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Communication from the New York City Council - Submitting 
the name of John H. Banks, III to the Council regarding his 
appointment to the New York City Board of Corrections, for a 
term expiring on October 12, 2002, pursuant to Section 626 of 
Chapter 25 of the New York City Charter.

M 1347-2001

Preconsidered

Communication from the New York City Council - Submitting 
the name of Michael J. Regan to the Council regarding his 
appointment to the New York City Board of Corrections, for a 
term expiring on October 12, 2002, pursuant to Section 626 of 
Chapter 25 of the New York City Charter.

M 1348-2001

Preconsidered

Communication from the New York City Council - Submitting 
the name of Louis A. Cruz to the Council regarding his 
appointment to the New York City Board of Corrections, for a 
term expiring on October 12, 2007, pursuant to Section 626 of 
Chapter 25 of the New York City Charter.

M 1349-2001

Preconsidered

Communication from the Mayor - Submitting the name of 
Noach Dear to the Council for its advice and consent regarding 
his appointment as a member of the Taxi & Limousine 
Commission, pursuant to Section 31 and 2301 of the New 
York City Charter.

M 1336-2001
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Preconsidered

Communication from the Mayor - Submitting the name of 
Stanley K. Schlein to the Council for its advice and consent 
regarding his reappointment to the New York City Civil 
Service Commission, pursuant to Section 31 and 813 of the 
New York City Charter.

M 1325-2001

AND SUCH OTHER BUSINESS AS MAY BE NECESSARY
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