Staff:
Edward Atkin, Counsel to the Committee


Cullen Howe, Legislative Attorney

Guillermo Patino, Legislative Policy Analyst

Amy Stokes, Legislative Financial Analyst





[image: image1.png]



THE COUNCIL
REPORT OF THE INFRASTRUCTURE DIVISION

ROBERT NEWMAN, LEGISLATIVE DIRECTOR 

COMMITTEE ON HOUSING AND BUILDINGS

Hon. Erik Martin Dilan, Chair

October 30, 2013

PROPOSED INT. NO. 983-A:
By Council Members Arroyo, Brewer, Cabrera, Chin, Comrie, Dickens, Eugene, Ferraras, Fidler, Gentile, González, Jackson, James, King, Koppell, Mark-Viverito, Mendez, Nelson, Palma, Reyna, Williams, Wills, Lappin, Rodriguez and Gennaro

TITLE:
A Local Law to amend the New York city building code, in relation to flood-resistant construction requirements for health facilities.
BUILDING CODE:
Amends sections BC 202, G106.4, G201.2, and G304.1.2.

PROPOSED INT. NO. 990-A
By Council Members Ulrich, Oddo, Arroyo, Cabrera, Comrie, Gentile, González, James, Nelson, Vallone, Wills, Rodriguez, Lappin, Gennaro and Halloran

TITLE:
A Local Law to amend the administrative code of the city of New York and the New York city building code, in relation to the adoption of best available flood maps

ADMINISTRATIVE CODE:
Amends section 28-104.7.6.

BUILDING CODE:
Amends sections BC 202, G201.2, and BC G402 and adds sections G102.2.1, G102.2.2, G102.3.1.1, and G102.3.2.1.

PROPOSED INT. NO. 1085-A:
By Council Members Chin, Brewer, González, James, Koo, Koppell, Lander, Mendez, Richards, Rose, Rodriguez, Arroyo and Barron

TITLE:
A Local Law to amend the administrative code of the city of New York, in relation to emergency preparedness recommendations for owners of residential and commercial buildings and the posting of emergency information in certain residential buildings.

ADMINISTRATIVE CODE:
Adds new sections 27-2051.1 and 30-113.

PROPOSED INT. NO. 1089-A:
By Council Members González, Chin, Comrie, James, Koo, Lander, Mendez, Richards, Rose and Gennaro

TITLE:
A Local Law to amend the administrative code of the city of New York, the New York city building code and the New York city mechanical code, in relation to cabling for certain building systems and fuel-oil storage in flood-prone areas.

ADMINISTRATIVE CODE:
Amends sections 27-3003.1 and 27-3025.

BUILDING CODE:
Amends sections BC 202, G102.1, and G201.2 and adds sections G103.3.1 and G307.4.

MECHANICAL CODE:
Amends section 1305.11.1.3.

PROPOSED INT. NO. 1096-A:
By Council Members Oddo, Chin, Comrie, Dickens, Fidler, James, Koo, Lander, Mendez, Recchia, Richards, Rose and Gennaro

TITLE:
A Local Law to amend the New York city building code, the New York city mechanical code and the New York city fire code, in relation to relocating and protecting building systems in flood-prone areas.

BUILDING CODE:
Amends section G304.1.1, G304.2, G501.1, Q102.1, and Q105.1 and adds new sections G304.4 and G307.5.

MECHANICAL CODE:
Amends section 301.13.

FIRE CODE:
Adds new sections 904.3.6, 2703.2.4.3, and 3501.5 and amends sections 2703.2.4, 3003.3.1, and 3203.1.2.

PROPOSED INT. NO. 1099-A:
By Council Members Richards, Chin, James, Koo, Lander, Mendez, Recchia, Rose, Barron, Van Bramer and Gennaro

TITLE:
A Local Law to amend the New York city building code and the New York city mechanical code, in relation to preventing wind damage to certain buildings and systems.

BUILDING CODE:
Amends sections 1609.1.2 and chapter 35.

MECHANICAL CODE:
Adds new sections 401.6.1 and 501.2.2.1 and amends chapter 15.

Introduction and Procedural History


On October 30, 2013, the Committee on Housing and Buildings, chaired by Council Member Erik Martin Dilan, will conduct a hearing on Proposed Int. 983-A, Proposed Int. 990-A, Proposed Int. 1085-A, Proposed Int. 1089-A, Proposed Int. 1096-A, and Proposed Int. No. 1099-A.


On June 27, 2013, the Committee held a hearing on these bills and received testimony from the New York City Office of Long Term Planning and Sustainability; the Urban Green Council; the International Code Council; Gilsanz, Murray, Steficek; the American Institute of Architects; Riverkeeper; the National Resources Defense Council; and the Plumbing Foundation. The Committee also received feedback from additional stakeholders after the hearing. In light of the received feedback and testimony, the bills have been amended as described below.

Hurricane Sandy and the Building Resiliency Task Force

On October 29, 2012, Hurricane Sandy struck New York City causing record storm surges and flooding throughout Lower Manhattan, Brooklyn, Staten Island, Coney Island, and the Rockaways.
 Forty-three New Yorkers lost their lives; many more were injured; and tens of thousands were temporarily or permanently displaced.
 In addition, Sandy caused roughly $19 billion in “infrastructure and property damage and economic loss” to the city.


In November 2012, Mayor Bloomberg and Council Speaker Christine Quinn announced the formation of the Building Resiliency Task Force (“BRTF”).
 BRTF, overseen by the Urban Green Council, is a collection of “more than 200 dedicated volunteers who are leading experts in their fields” including “real estate owners, property managers, architects, engineers, contractors, utility representatives, subject matter specialists, city officials, code consultants, cost estimators and attorneys.”
 In June 2013, BRTF issued a report with 33 proposals for improving building resiliency in the city for both new and existing buildings.
 Those BRTF proposals formed the basis for several of the bills now under consideration.

Flood-Prone Areas and Flood Construction Requirements

Generally, new or substantially improved buildings located in flood-prone areas within the city must comply with special flood construction requirements – for example, such buildings typically must have their lowest floors and utilities elevated above expected flood levels or be otherwise protected from floodwaters.
 The city’s flood-prone areas are delineated on “flood insurance rate maps” (“FIRMs”) that are issued by the Federal Emergency Management Agency (“FEMA”).
 The last substantial update to the city’s FIRMs was in 1983 – 30 years ago.

FEMA is currently in the process of updating the city’s FIRMs.
 The agency released “preliminary work maps” in June 2013 and plans to release “preliminary FIRMs” sometime in the fall of 2013.
 After a period of public comment and an appeal period, the City will adopt “final” FIRMs, which would become the city’s flood map and the official basis for identifying flood-prone areas.
 The City and FEMA expect final FIRMs to take effect in early 2015.

Proposed Int. No. 983-A


Proposed Int. No. 983-A would take effect immediately and would require that certain patient care areas and sleeping areas be elevated above expected flood levels for new or substantially improved non-residential buildings located in flood-prone areas.


Bill section one would amend section BC 202 of the Building Code to add a new definition of “PATIENT CARE AREA (FOR FLOOD ZONE PURPOSES),” which refers to section G201.2 of Appendix G for the definition of such term.


Bill section two would amend section G106.4 of Appendix G of the Building Code to require that the certificate of occupancy for a building with “patient care areas (for flood zone purposes) or spaces intended to be used by persons for sleeping purposes” must contain the notations required by section G304.1.2, Item 2.2.5. That item requires that a restrictive declaration noting that certain information shall be filed with the City Register or County Clerk, and the page number and liber number shall be identified in the permit application and on the certificate of occupancy.


Bill section three would amend section G201.2 of Appendix G of the Building Code to add a new definition of “PATIENT CARE AREA (FOR FLOOD ZONE PURPOSES).” This term would be defined as a space that is (1) “located within a building or structure, or portion thereof, that is classified in Group I-2”
 and (2) “primarily used for the provision of medical services to persons, including, but not limited to, consultation, evaluation, monitoring and treatment services.” The definition contains an exception providing that “emergency rooms or departments” and spaces primarily used for the provision of special medical services
 are not to be considered “patient care areas (for flood zone purposes).”


Bill section four would amend item 2.2 of section G304.1.2 of Appendix G of the Building Code to require that patient care areas (for flood zone purposes) and “spaces intended to be used by persons for sleeping purposes” be elevated to or above the applicable design flood elevation.


Bill section five contains the enactment clause and provides that this local law would take effect immediately upon enactment.

Amendments to Int. No. 983


The bill has been amended so that in health facilities in flood-prone areas only certain patient care areas and sleeping areas in such facilities would be required to be elevated rather than all areas within such facilities.

Proposed Int. No. 990-A


Proposed Int. No. 990-A would take effect thirty days after FEMA releases preliminary FIRMs and would adopt such preliminary FIRMs as the city’s flood maps until FEMA issues and the City’s Department of Buildings (“DOB”) adopts new final FIRMs by rule.



Bill section one would amend section 28-104.7.6 of the Administrative Code to require that elevations noted in construction documents be specified in reference to the North American Vertical Datum of 1988 (“NAVD”) rather than the National Geodetic Vertical Datum of 1929 (“NGVD”). The amendments would further provide that neither NGVD nor any of the borough-specific elevation data are to be used in construction documents except to the extent necessary to demonstrate conversion to appropriate NAVD.


Bill section two would amend section BC 202 of the Building Code to add a new definition of “NORTH AMERICAN VERTICAL DATUM (NAVD),” which refers to section G201.2 of Appendix G for the definition of such term.


Bill section three would add new sections G102.2.1, G102.2.2, G102.3.1.1, and G102.3.2.1 to Appendix G of the Building Code.


New section G102.2.1 would adopt FEMA’s preliminary FIRMs and preliminary flood insurance study until DOB adopts new final FIRMs by rule.


New section G102.2.2 would provide that all elevations referenced in Appendix G shall refer to the greater of (i) the elevations identified on the current FIRMs or (ii) the elevations identified on the preliminary FIRMs. This section also provides that references to “areas of special flood hazard” in Appendix G shall refer to such areas as delineated on the current FIRMs or the preliminary FIRMs, whichever shows a more restrictive special flood hazard area.


New section G102.3.1.1 would provide that, until DOB adopts new final FIRMs, no “letter of map amendment” (“LOMA”) issued by FEMA shall serve to remove a structure from the area of special flood hazard unless the elevations specified in that LOMA equal or exceed the elevations shown on the preliminary FIRM.


New section G102.3.2.1 would provide that, until DOB adopts new final FIRMs, no “letter of map revision based on fill” (“LOMR-F”) issued by FEMA shall serve to remove a structure from the area of special flood hazard unless the elevations specified in that LOMR-F equal or exceed the elevations shown on the preliminary FIRM.


Bill section three would amend section G201.2 of Appendix G of the Building Code to amend the definitions of “BASE FLOOD ELEVATION,” make a technical edit to the definition of “FLOOD INSURANCE RATE MAP (FIRM),” and add a new definition for “NORTH AMERICAN VERTICAL DATUM (NAVD).” 

The amendment to the definition of “BASE FLOOD ELEVATION” would provide that, in areas designated as Zone AO, “the base flood elevation shall be the highest existing grade of the building’s perimeter plus the depth number (in feet) specified on the flood hazard map.”

The new definition of “NORTH AMERICAN VERTICAL DATUM (NAVD)” provides that such term shall mean “[t]he national vertical datum standard established in 1988, used as a reference for establishing elevations within a flood plain.”

Bill section four would amend section BC G402 of Appendix G of the Building Code to add the preliminary FIRMs and FEMA’s preliminary flood insurance study to the list of reference standards for Appendix G.

Bill section five contains the enactment clause and provides that this local law would take effect 30 days after FEMA releases the next preliminary FIRMs and preliminary flood insurance study for the city.

Amendments to Int. No. 990


The bill has been amended to provide that, prior to FEMA’s issuance and the City’s adoption of final FIRMs, the city’s flood map will be the preliminary FIRMs rather than the advisory base flood elevation maps released by FEMA shortly after Hurricane Sandy. The enactment clause has been amended so that this local law would take effect 30 days after FEMA releases preliminary FIRMs rather than immediately upon enactment.

Proposed Int. No. 1085-A

Proposed Int. No. 1085-A would require that the City compile recommendations for how residential and commercial property owners can prepare for emergencies and communicate emergency-related information to tenants. The bill would also require residential building owners to provide certain emergency-related information to tenants.

Bill section one would add a new section 30-113 to the Administrative Code requiring that the Office of Emergency Management (“OEM”), in coordination with DOB, the Department of Housing Preservation and Development and the Fire Department, compile recommendations for how residential and commercial property owners may prepare for and communicate certain information to the tenants of such buildings in the event of a weather emergency, a natural disaster or a utility outage expected to last more than twenty-four hours. At a minimum, such recommendations shall include (1) information on determining the property’s flood zone and evacuation zone; (2) the protective measures the building owner may provide or install to protect against flooding or other damage; (3) general advice on securing items appended to the building, such as window air conditioning units, patio furniture, flower boxes, windows, doors and other loose items, during a weather emergency or natural disaster; (4) general advice for buildings in flood zones on the use of electrical and mechanical equipment when there is a flood risk; (5) the types of options available to the property owner to rent equipment after a weather emergency, a natural disaster or pending the restoration of  utility services; (6) the methods that the property owner may use to communicate with tenants during and after a weather emergency, a natural disaster or a utility outage which is expected to last for more than twenty-four hours and suggestions for communicating to tenants about relevant building contacts for emergencies; and (7) the contact information for relevant City agencies to determine evacuation guidelines or learn other suggestions for protecting persons and property during a weather emergency, a natural disaster or a utility outage expected to last more than twenty-four hours.


Bill section two would add a new section 27-2051.1 to the Administrative Code. Section 27-2051.1 would require the owner of a residential dwelling to temporarily post certain emergency information in common areas prior to the expected arrival of a weather emergency, a natural disaster or after being informed about a utility outage expected to last more than twenty-four hours. Such posting must include (1) whether the building is located in a hurricane evacuation zone as defined by the OEM and, if applicable, which zone the building is located in; (2) the address of the nearest designated evacuation center; (3) when a person should contact 911 and 311 during a weather  emergency, a natural disaster or the utility outage; (4) whether services such as potable water, corridor, egress, and common area lighting, fire safety and fire protection, elevators, charging locations for cellular telephones, domestic hot water, or heating and cooling will be provided during the utility outage; (5) contact information for building personnel in the event of an emergency, including email addresses, phone numbers and other methods of communication; (6) instructions on removing furniture from rooftops and balconies during high wind events; and (7) for buildings that utilize pumps, instructions on reducing water consumption during the utility outage. Such posting shall be updated by the owner of the residential building as needed and must be removed after the passage of the weather emergency, the natural disaster or the restoration of utility services. This section would also require that the Department of Housing Preservation and Development determine the form of such signs including publishing a template that may be used by residential buildings.

Bill section three contains the enactment clause and provides that this local law would take effect 180 days after its enactment, provided however, that the Department of Housing Preservation and Development shall take all necessary action, including the promulgation of rules, prior to such effective date.

Amendments to Int. No. 1085

The bill has been amended in the following manner: 

· Technical changes were made throughout the bill for the purposes of clarity and to revise organization of the text.

· Bill section one was amended to require OEM to in addition to other agencies coordinate with the Fire Department when compiling recommendations for how residential and commercial property owners may prepare for and communicate certain information to the tenants of such buildings in the event of a weather emergency, a natural disaster or a utility outage expected to last more than twenty-four hours. 

· Bill section two was amended (1) to require that the owner of a residential dwelling temporarily post the contact information for relevant city agencies to determine evacuation guidelines or learn other suggestions on how to protect persons and property during a weather emergency, a natural disaster or utility outage which is expected to last for more than twenty-four hours; (2) to remove the requirement that owners post guidelines for tenants sheltering in place, including tenants aged sixty-two and older and tenants with disabilities; (3) to require that temporary postings be updated by the owner of the residential building as needed and removed after the passage of the weather emergency, the natural disaster or the restoration of utility services; and (4) to require that the Department of Housing Preservation and Development determine the form of such temporary postings including publishing a template that may be used by residential buildings.

· The enactment clause of the bill was amended so that this local law would take effect 180 days, rather than 90 days, after enactment, provided however, that the Department of Housing Preservation and Development shall take all necessary action, including the promulgation of rules, prior to such effective date.

Proposed Int. No. 1089-A


Proposed Int. No. 1089-A would extend the permissible length of certain optical fiber cabling in buildings located in flood-prone areas. The bill would also allow buildings in flood-prone areas to store additional fuel-oil on the lowest story having its floor above expected flood levels.


Bill section one would amend section 27-3003.1 of the Administrative Code to provide that electrical work performed on structures located in areas of special flood hazard or shaded X-Zones, as such terms are defined in section G201.2 of Appendix G of the Building Code, shall comply with such appendix in addition to the Electrical Code. The amendments to this section further provide that, in the event of a conflict between Appendix G and the Electrical Code, the more restrictive of the two shall govern.


Bill section two would amend section 27-3025 of the Administrative Code to add new amendments to subsection 770.48(A) of the National Electrical Code. The new amendments would add two exceptions to such subsection. The first exception would provide that, in areas of special flood hazard, the length of “unlisted conductive and nonconductive outside plant optical fiber cables” within buildings may exceed 50 feet “to the extent necessary to provide direct delivery to a level of 5 feet above the design flood elevation specified in Section 7.1 (Table 7-1) of Section G501.1 of Appendix G” provided that (1) such cabling does not extend more than 10 feet “beyond the lowest story having its floor above the design flood elevation” and (2) such cabling is not installed in ducts used for environmental air or in plenums used for environmental air. The second exception would provide that, in shaded X-Zones, the length of “unlisted conductive and nonconductive outside plant optical fiber cables” within buildings may exceed 50 feet “to the extent necessary to provide direct delivery to a level of 5 feet above the 500-year flood elevation” provided that (1) such cabling does not extend more than 10 feet “beyond the lowest story having its floor above the design flood elevation” and (2) such cabling is not installed in ducts used for environmental air or in plenums used for environmental air.


Bill section three would amend section 27-3025 of the Administrative Code to add new amendments to subsection 800.48 of the National Electrical Code, which concerns certain communication cabling. The new amendments would add two exceptions to such subsection, and the exceptions would be identical to those set forth in bill section two discussed above.


Bill section four would amend section BC 202 of the Building Code to add new definitions for “500-YEAR FLOOD ELEVATION” and “SHADED X-ZONE,” which refer to section G201.2 of Appendix G for the definitions of such terms.


Bill section five would amend section G102.1 of Appendix G of the Building Code to provide that Appendix G also applies to certain development located in shaded X-Zones.


Bill section six would add a new section G103.3.1 to Appendix G of the Building Code. The new section would provide that, where 500-year flood elevations are not specified on the city’s FIRMs, such elevations “shall be determined by a registered design professional using modeling based on generally accepted engineering methods or a review of available data from city, state and federal agencies.”


Bill section seven would amend section G201.2 of Appendix G of the Building Code to add new definitions of “500-YEAR FLOOD ELEVATION” and “SHADED X-ZONE.”


The new definition of “500-YEAR FLOOD ELEVATION” would be “[t]he elevation of the flood having a 0.2-percent chance of being equaled or exceeded in any given year” as specified on the FIRMs or FEMA’s flood insurance study.


The new definition of “SHADED X-ZONE” would be “[t]he land in the floodplain delineated as subject to a 0.2-percent or greater chance of flooding, but less than one percent chance of flooding, in any given year. Such areas are designated on the Flood Insurance Rate Map (FIRM) as shaded X-Zones.”


Bill section eight would add new sections G307.4, G307.4.1, G307.4.1.1, and G307.4.1.2 to Appendix G of the Building Code. New section G307.4 would allow fuel-oil storage of up to 3,000 gallons on the lowest story having its floor above either the applicable design flood elevation (in areas of special flood hazard) or the 500-year flood elevation (in shaded X-Zones). The section further requires that no individual storage tank may exceed “the lesser of 1,500 gallons (5678 L) or the quantity of fuel-oil needed to operate the emergency or standby generators(s) served by such tank for 24 hours.”


New section 307.4.1 would require that, where fuel-oil storage exceeds the limits set forth in section 1305.11.1.3 of the Mechanical Code,
 such fuel-oil storage must comply with sections G307.4.1.1 and G307.4.1.2 in addition to section 1305 of the Mechanical Code. Section G307.4.1.1 requires that fuel-oil storage tanks be enclosed in a vault that (1) has walls, a floor, and a top with fire resistance rating of not less than 3 hours; (2) has walls bonded to the floor of the vault; (3) has top and walls independent of the building structure; and (4) is “located in a dedicated room or area of the building that is separated vertically and horizontally from other areas of the building by construction having a fire resistance rating of not less than 2 hours.” Section G307.4.1.1 further provides that an exterior building wall having a fire resistance rating of not less than 3 hours may serve as a vault wall. Section G307.4.1.2 requires that fuel-oil storage be protected with an alternative automatic fire-extinguishing system in accordance with section 904 of the Building Code.


Bill section nine would amend section 1305.11.1.3 of the Mechanical Code to add a new exception which provides that fuel-oil storage in areas of special flood hazard and shaded X-Zones must comply with section G307.4 of the Building Code.


Bill section ten contains the enactment clause and provides that this local law would take effect immediately upon enactment.

Amendments to Int. No. 1089


The bill has been amended in the following substantive manner:

· Certain optical fiber cables and certain communications cables utilizing an extended length under the bill would be allowed to extend no more than 3 feet beyond the lowest story having its floor above the design flood elevation (in areas of special flood hazard) or the 500-year flood elevation (in shaded X-Zones). Such cabling must not be installed in ducts used for environmental air or in plenums used for environmental air.

· The term “500-year flood elevation” has been substituted for “moderate flood elevation,” and the term “shaded X-Zone” has been substituted for “area of moderate flood hazard.”

· The vaulting and alternative extinguishing system requirements now apply only to fuel-oil storage that exceeds the capacity limits of section 1305.11.1.3, rather than to all fuel-oil storage in areas of special flood hazard and shaded X-Zones.

Proposed Int. No. 1096-A


Proposed Int. No. 1096-A would require that new or substantially improved buildings in flood-prone areas elevate certain building systems, including certain fire protection systems and equipment, fire alarm system components, fuel-oil piping system components, and plumbing system components. The bill would also require that new or substantially improved hospitals in the 500-year flood plain (i.e. shaded X-Zones) comply with flood construction requirements. This local law would take effect on the same date that Int. No. 1056, a local law relating to bringing the city’s Construction Codes up to date with international codes, takes effect.


Bill section one would add new items 5.1, 5.2, 5.3, and 5.4 to section G304.1.1 of Appendix G of the Building Code, which sets forth flood construction requirements for new or substantially improved residential buildings located in areas of special flood hazard.


New item 5.1 would require that the following fire protection systems and equipment be located at or above the applicable design flood elevation except where such systems or equipment serves only spaces that are located below the design flood elevation: (1) sprinkler control valves that are not outside stem and yoke valves; (2) fire standpipe control valves that are not outside stem and yoke valves; (3) sprinkler booster pumps and fire pumps; (4) dry pipe valve-related electrically operated alarm appurtenances; (5) alarm control panels for water and non-water fire extinguishing systems; (6) alarm control panels for sprinkler systems, pre-action sprinkler systems, deluge sprinkler systems, and combined dry pipe and pre-action sprinkler systems; (7) electrically operated waterflow detection devices serving sprinkler systems; and (8) air compressors serving sprinklers systems and pre-action sprinkler systems.


New item 5.2 would require that, where a zoning indicator panel is provided at the main building entrance in accordance with section 907.6.3.1 of the Building Code and such panel is located at or below 5 feet above the applicable design flood elevation, then at least one secondary zoning indicator panel must be provided. The secondary panel, associated controls, power supplies, and means of transferring control must be at least 5 feet above the applicable design flood elevation and in a location that is accessible to Fire Department personnel and approved by DOB and the Fire Department. Where the secondary panel or associated controls are only operable upon transfer of control from another zoning indicator panel, such transfer must be by means approved by the Fire Department.


New item 5.3 would require that fill piping, normal vent piping, and emergency vent piping for fuel-oil systems terminate at least 3 feet above the applicable design flood elevation; provided that fill piping may instead terminate in a watertight terminal approved by DOB.


New item 5.4 would require that (1) relief vents and fresh air intakes serving building traps be carried above grade and terminate in a screened outlet located outside of the building and at or above the applicable design flood elevation and (2) reduced pressure principle backflow preventers and backflow preventers with intermediate atmospheric vents be located at or above the applicable design flood elevation.


Bill section two would add a new item 2.3.1 to section G304.1.2 of Appendix G of the Building Code, which sets forth flood construction requirements for new or substantially improved nonresidential buildings in areas of special flood hazard. The new item would require that such structures comply with items 5.1 through 5.4 of section G304.1.1.


Bill section three would add a new item 5.1 to section G304.2 of Appendix G of the Building Code, which sets forth flood construction requirements for new or substantially improved buildings in V-Zones. The new item would require that such structures comply with items 5.1 through 5.4 of section G304.1.1.


Bill section four would add a new section G304.4 to Appendix G of the Building Code requiring that new or substantially improved hospitals located in shaded X-Zones comply with the flood construction requirements for hospitals located in A-Zones.


Bill section five would add a new section G307.5 to Appendix G of the Building Code requiring that the following tanks or containers must be located at or above the applicable design flood elevation, or the higher of such design flood elevation or the 500-year flood elevation where such tanks/containers serve a hospital: (1) medical and compressed gas storage tanks, oxygen tanks, and other cryogenic system storage tanks; (2) hazardous material storage tanks; (3) stationary compressed gas containers; (4) stationary cryogenic containers; and (5) stationary flammable gas storage containers. Such tanks/containers must also comply with section 9.6 of ASCE 24 “Flood Resistant Design and Construction” standard and be designed to maintain service during flood conditions.


Bill section six would amend tables 2-1, 4-1, 5-1, 6-1, and 7-1 of ASCE 24, as modified by section G501.1 of Appendix G of the Building Code, which set forth applicable design flood elevations. The amendments to the tables would add a footnote to each providing that, for hospitals, the design flood elevation shall be the greater of (i) the design flood elevation found by reference to the applicable table or (ii) the 500-year flood elevation.


Bill section seven would amend section G501.1 of Appendix G of the Building Code, which sets forth amendments to ASCE 24, a reference standard incorporated into the Building Code. This bill section would add an amendment to section 7.2.4 of ASCE 24 to require that all electrical service disconnecting means be located at or above and be accessible from the applicable design flood elevation. The amendment would also require that either electrical switches, all service disconnecting means, and circuit breakers be located no more than 6 feet 8 inches above the floor or that a platform be installed to provide access.


Bill section eight would amend the modification to section 23.2.2.4(c) of NFPA 13, “Standard for the Installation of Sprinkler Systems,” set forth in section Q102.1 of Appendix Q of the Building Code to require that sprinkler booster pumps be enclosed.


Bill section nine would amend the modification to section 9.1.5(2)(f) of NFPA 14, “Standard for the Installation of Standpipe and Hose Systems,” set forth in section Q105.1 of Appendix Q of the Building Code to require that fire pumps be located in a 2-hour fire-rated enclosure.


Bill section ten would amend section 301.13 of the Mechanical Code to provide that, for hospitals located in shaded X-Zones, mechanical systems, equipment, and appliances must comply with Appendix G of the Building Code.


Bill section eleven would amend section 904.3.6 to require that non-water fire extinguishing system control panels in areas of special flood hazard or on the premises of hospitals located in shaded X-Zones must be located at or above the applicable design flood elevation specified in Appendix G of the Building Code.


Bill section twelve would amend section 2703.2 of the Fire Code to make a technical edit and add a new section 2703.2.4.3 requiring that hazardous material storage tanks located in areas of special flood hazard or on the premises of hospitals located in shaded X-Zones must comply with section G307.5 of Appendix G of the Building Code.


Bill section thirteen would amend section 3003.3.1 of the Fire Code to require that stationary compressed gas containers located in areas of special flood hazard or on the premises of hospitals located in shaded X-Zones must comply with section G307.5 of Appendix G of the Building Code.


Bill section fourteen would amend section 3203.1.2 of the Fire Code to require that stationary cryogenic containers located in areas of special flood hazard or on the premises of hospitals located in shaded X-Zones must comply with section G307.5 of Appendix G of the Building Code.

Bill section fifteen would amend section 3501.5 of the Fire Code to require that stationary flammable gas containers located in areas of special flood hazard or on the premises of hospitals located in shaded X-Zones must comply with section G307.5 of Appendix G of the Building Code.
Bill section sixteen contains the enactment clause and provides that this local law would take effect on the same date that Int. No. 1056, a local law relating to bringing the city’s Construction Codes up to date with international codes, takes effect.

Amendments to Int. No. 1096

The bill has been amended in the following manner:

· Technical changes were made throughout the bill for the purposes of clarity and to revise organization of the text.
· The term “500-year flood elevation” has been substituted for “moderate flood elevation,” and the term “shaded X-Zone” has been substituted for “area of moderate flood hazard.”

· Fire protection systems and equipment, or portions thereof, serving only areas below the applicable design flood elevation may be located below such design flood elevation.

· In buildings where all occupied floors are less than 300 feet above the lowest level of Fire Department access, sprinkler booster pumps and fire pumps serving areas above the applicable design flood elevation would be required to be elevated above such design flood elevation unless only serving areas located below such design flood elevation.

· Fill piping for fuel-oil systems may either be elevated to or above the applicable design flood elevation or shall terminate in a watertight enclosure approved by DOB. Further, this requirement would apply only in areas of special flood hazard and to hospitals in shaded X-Zones rather than to all buildings in such areas.

Proposed Int. No. 1099-A

Proposed Int. No. 1099-A would require certain buildings located in areas of the city subject to high velocity wind speeds to utilize certain materials if they provide enclosed places of assembly for 300 or more people or provide louvers or garage doors. Exterior louvers for building ventilation and exhaust systems must also protect against wind-driven rain penetration.    

Bill section one would require certain buildings located in areas of the city subject to high velocity wind speeds to use a certain impact-resistant covering or glazing if they provide enclosed places of assembly for 300 or more people or provide louvers or garage doors.  

Bill section two would require that exterior louvers for building ventilation systems must protect against wind-driven rain penetration.

Bill section three would require that exterior louvers for building exhaust systems must protect against wind-driven rain penetration.

Bill section four would add new reference standards ASTM E 1886, ASTM E 1996, and ANSI/DASMA 115 to the Building Code.

Bill section five would add new reference standard AMCA 550 to the Mechanical Code.

Bill section six contains the enactment clause and provides that this local law would take effect on the same date that Int. No. 1056, a local law relating to bringing the city’s Construction Codes up to date with international codes, takes effect.

Amendments to Int. No. 1099
The bill has been amended in the following substantive manner:

· The bill was amended to remove language which would have provided that the installation and alteration of curtain wall systems, windows, doors, attachments, fixtures, building mounted equipment, and equipment enclosures must meet certain wind resistance requirements.  

· The bill was amended to remove a requirement that curtain wall systems, windows, doors, fixtures and building mounted equipment be designed to remain intact and firmly attached to buildings or other structures when subjected to certain minimum wind loads, and that the design of such systems and fixtures be verified by engineering calculations or manufacturer certification.

THIS PAGE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK.

Proposed Int. No. 983-A

By Council Members Arroyo, Brewer, Cabrera, Chin, Comrie, Dickens, Eugene, Ferreras, Fidler, Gentile, González, Jackson, James, King, Koppell, Mark-Viverito, Mendez, Nelson, Palma, Reyna, Williams, Wills, Lappin and Rodriguez

A Local Law

To amend the New York city building code, in relation to flood-resistant construction requirements for health facilities.

Be it enacted by the Council as follows:

Section 1.Section BC 202 of the New York city building code is amended by adding a new definition of “PATIENT CARE AREA (FOR FLOOD ZONE PURPOSES)” in appropriate alphabetical order to read as follows:

PATIENT CARE AREA (FOR FLOOD ZONE PURPOSES). See Section G201.2.

§2. Section G106.4 of the New York city building code, as added by local law number 33 for the year 2007, is amended to read as follows:

G106.4 Dry floodproofed spaces. The certificate of occupancy shall describe any dry floodproofed spaces as [“dry floodproofed”.] “dry floodproofed.” For such buildings containing dwelling units, patient care areas (for flood zone purposes) or spaces intended to be used by persons for sleeping purposes, the certificate of occupancy shall also provide the notations required by Section G304.1.2, Item 2.2.5. Where flood shields or other flood control devices are installed, the certificate of occupancy shall also provide notations describing these features.

§3. Section G201.2 of the New York city building code is amended by adding a new definition of “PATIENT CARE AREA (FOR FLOOD ZONE PURPOSES)” in appropriate alphabetical order to read as follows:

PATIENT CARE AREA (FOR FLOOD ZONE PURPOSES). Any space meeting the following conditions:

1. The space is located within a building or structure, or portion thereof, that is classified in Group I-2; and

2. The space is primarily used for the provision of medical services to persons, including, but not limited to, consultation, evaluation, monitoring and treatment services.

Exceptions: The following spaces shall not be considered patient care areas (for flood zone purposes):

1. “Emergency rooms or departments” as defined in 10 NYCRR 700.2(a)(2) and

2. Spaces primarily used for the provision of medical services identified in 10 NYCRR 703.6(c)(2)(i).

§4. Item 2.2 of section G304.1.2 of the New York city building code, as added by local law number 33 for the year 2007, is amended to read as follows:

2.2 Dwelling units, patient care areas (for flood zone purposes) and sleeping spaces. Where dwelling units, patient care areas (for flood zone purposes) or spaces intended to be used by persons for sleeping purposes are located in a building utilizing the dry floodproofing option, the following additional requirements shall be met:

2.2.1. All rooms and spaces within dwelling units, patient care areas (for flood zone purposes) and all spaces intended to be used by persons for sleeping purposes shall be located at or above the design flood elevation;

2.2.2. [No] For buildings containing dwelling units, no more than one toilet and one sink shall be located below the design flood elevation. Any such toilet room shall not be located within a dwelling unit and shall be no larger than required by Chapter 11; and no roughing therein shall be permitted to accommodate additional fixtures;

2.2.3. [No] For buildings containing dwelling units, no more than one two-compartment laundry tray shall be permitted below the design flood elevation;

2.2.4. [No] For buildings containing dwelling units, no kitchens or kitchenettes shall be permitted below the design flood elevation;

2.2.5. A restrictive declaration noting the above restrictions shall be filed with the City Register or County Clerk, and the page number and liber number shall be identified in the permit application and on the certificate of occupancy.


§5.  This local law shall take effect immediately.

10/22/2013 10:02PM

Proposed Int. No. 990-A

By Council Members Ulrich, Oddo, Arroyo, Cabrera, Comrie, Gentile, González, James, Nelson, Vallone, Wills, Rodriguez, Lappin and Halloran

A Local Law

To amend the administrative code of the city of New York and the New York city building code, in relation to the adoption of best available flood maps.

Be it enacted by the Council as follows:

Section 1. Section 28-104.7.6 of the administrative code of the city of New York, as added by local law number 33 for the year 2007, is amended to read as follows:

§28-104.7.6 City datum. All elevations noted in the con​struction documents shall be referred to and clearly identi​fied as the [United States coast and geodetic survey mean sea level datum of 1929 (national geodetic vertical datum, “NGVD”)] North American vertical datum of 1988 (“NAVD”) as established and maintained by National Geodetic Survey of the National Ocean Service, National Oceanic and Atmospheric Administration or successor agency, which is hereby established as the city datum. Neither the United States coast and geodetic survey mean sea level datum of 1929 (national geodetic vertical datum, “NGVD”) nor any of the five borough data as established by the former Board of Estimate and Apportionment shall be referred to in construction documents except as may be required for the purpose of demonstrating conversion to the NAVD. Conversions to NAVD shall be performed by registered design professionals or surveyors. [By way of examples,] Conversion to and from borough data and NGVD shall be performed using tables 104.7.6.1 through 104.7.6.5 [shall be used to convert borough elevations to their corre​sponding equivalent NGVD elevations].

§2. Section BC 202 of the New York city building code is amended by adding a new definition of “NORTH AMERICAN VERTICAL DATUM (NAVD)” in appropriate alphabetical order to read as follows:

NORTH AMERICAN VERTICAL DATUM (NAVD). See Section G201.2.

§3. Appendix G of the New York city building code is amended by adding new sections G102.2.1, G102.2.2, G102.3.1.1 and G102.3.2.1 to read as follows: 

G102.2.1 Preliminary flood insurance study and rate maps. Until such time that the department by rule adopts revised FEMA FIS 360497 and FEMA FIRMs 360497 with a final effective date later than May 1, 2014, the following flood hazard maps and supporting data are also adopted as a referenced standard and declared a part of this appendix. 

1. FEMA PFIS 360497.

2. FEMA PFIRMs 360497.

G102.2.2 Effect of preliminary flood insurance study and rate maps. Notwithstanding any other provision in this appendix to the contrary:

1. All references in this appendix to elevations in FEMA FIS 360497 and FEMA FIRMs 360497 shall be deemed to refer to the greater of (i) the elevations identified in the FEMA FIS 360497/FEMA FIRMs 360497 or (ii) the elevations identified in the FEMA PFIS 360497/FEMA PFIRMs 360497. In comparing elevations, the elevations identified in FEMA FIS 360497 and FEMA FIRMs 360497 that are expressed in relation to the National Geodetic Vertical Datum (NGVD) shall be converted to the North American Vertical Datum (NAVD).

2. All references in this appendix to areas of special flood hazard as delineated on FEMA FIRMs 360497 shall be deemed to refer to the area of special flood hazard as delineated on FEMA PFIRMs 360497 except that, where a structure is located in an area of special flood hazard as delineated on FEMA PFIRMs 360497 and in a more restrictive area of special flood hazard as delineated on FEMA FIRMs 360497, such structure shall be deemed to be located in the more restrictive area of special flood hazard as delineated on FEMA FIRMs 360497.

G102.3.1.1 Letters of map amendment (LOMAs) during pendency of PFIRMs. Until such time that the department by rule adopts revised FEMA FIS 360497 and FEMA FIRMs 360497 with a final effective date later than May 1, 2014, the commissioner shall not deem issuance of a LOMA by FEMA as removing such structure or tax lot from the area of special flood hazard unless the elevations specified in the LOMA equal or exceed the applicable corresponding elevations on the FEMA PFIS 360497/FEMA PFIRMs 360497.

G102.3.2.1 Letters of map revision based on fill (LOMR-Fs) during pendency of PFIRMs. Until such time that the department by rule adopts revised FEMA FIS 360497 and FEMA FIRMs 360497 with a final effective date later than May 1, 2014, the commissioner shall not deem issuance of a LOMR-F as removing such structure or tax lot from the area of special flood hazard unless the elevations specified in the LOMR-F equal or exceed the applicable corresponding elevations on the FEMA PFIS 360497/FEMA PFIRMs 360497.

§4. Section G201.2 of the New York city building code is amended by amending the definitions of “BASE FLOOD ELEVATION” and “Flood Insurance Rate Map (FIRM),” as added by local law number 33 for the year 2007, and by adding a new definition for “NORTH AMERICAN VERTICAL DATUM (NAVD)” in appropriate alphabetical order, to read as follows:

BASE FLOOD ELEVATION. The elevation of the base flood, including wave height, as specified on FEMA FIRMs 360497 or as determined in accordance with Section G103.3[, relative to the National Geodetic Vertical Datum (NGVD)]. In areas designated as Zone AO, the base flood elevation shall be the elevation of the highest existing grade of the building’s perimeter plus the depth number (in feet) specified on the flood hazard map. 
FLOOD INSURANCE RATE MAP (FIRM). The official flood map on which the Federal Emergency Management Agency (FEMA) has delineated areas of special flood hazard, base flood elevations, and the flood boundary and floodways.

NORTH AMERICAN VERTICAL DATUM (NAVD). The national vertical datum standard established in 1988, used as a reference for establishing elevations within a flood plain.

§5.  Section BC G402 of the New York city building code, as amended by local law 8 for the year 2008, is amended to read as follows:

SECTION BC G402 STANDARDS

	ASCE 7-02
	Minimum Design Loads for Buildings and Other Structures
	G104.5.2, G201.2, G304.2

	ASCE 24-05*
	Flood Resistant Design and Construction
	G103.1, G104.3, G104.5.1, G104.5.2, G105.2, G105.3.1, G201.2, G301.1, G303.2, G303.3, G303.4, G303.7, G304.1.1, G304.1.2, G304.2, G305.1, G307.1, G307.2, G307.3, G308.1, G308.3

	FEMA FIS

360497
	Flood Insurance Study, Community Number 360497, Revised September 5, 2007; Federal Emergency Management Agency
	G102.2

	FEMA PFIS

360497
	Preliminary Flood Insurance Study, Community Number 360497, Federal Emergency Management Agency
	G102.2.1, G102.2.2, G102.3.1.1, G102.3.2.2

	FEMA FIRMs 360497
	Flood Insurance Rate Map, Community Number 360497, Panel Numbers 1 through 0457, Revised September 5, 2007; Federal Emergency Management Agency
	G102.2, G102.3, G102.3.1, G102.3.2, G103.3, G201.2



	FEMA PFIRMs 360497
	Preliminary Flood Insurance Rate Map, Community Number 360497,  Federal Emergency Management Agency
	G102.2.1, G102.2.2, G102.3.1.1, G102.3.2.1

	FEMA FORM 81-31
	Elevation Certificate; Federal Emergency Management Agency
	G105.3

	FEMA FORM 81-65
	Floodproofing Certification; Federal Emergency Management Agency
	G105.3



	HUD 24 CFR Part 3280-94
	Manufactured Home Construction Safety Standards, 1994
	G201.2


* As modified in Chapter G5.

§6.  This local law shall take effect thirty days after the Federal Emergency Management Agency issues the next Preliminary Flood Insurance Study, Community Number 360497, and Preliminary Flood Insurance Rate Map, Community Number 360497, following enactment of this local law.

10/25/2013 11:17AM

Proposed Int. No. 1085-A

By Council Members Chin, Brewer, Gonzalez, James, Koo, Koppell, Lander, Mendez, Richards, Rose, Rodriquez and Arroyo

A LOCAL LAW

To amend the administrative code of the city of New York, in relation to emergency preparedness recommendations for owners of residential and commercial buildings and the posting of emergency information in certain residential buildings.

Be it enacted by the Council as follows:

Section 1.  Chapter 1 of title 30 of the administrative code of the city of New York is amended by adding a new section 30-113 to read as follows:

§30-113 Weather emergencies and prolonged utility outage preparedness recommendations for residential and commercial buildings. a. Coordinating with relevant agencies including the department of buildings, the department of housing preservation and development, and the fire department, the commissioner shall compile recommendations for how residential and commercial property owners  may prepare for and communicate certain information to the tenants of such buildings in the event of a weather emergency, a natural disaster event or a utility outage which is expected to last for more than twenty-four hours. Such recommendations shall include, but not be limited to:

1. Information on determining the property’s flood zone and evacuation zone;


2. The protective measures the building owner may provide or install to protect against flooding or other damage;


3. General advice on securing items appended to the building, such as window air conditioning units, patio furniture flower boxes, windows, doors and other loose items, during a weather emergency or natural disaster event;


4. General advice for buildings in flood zones on the use of electrical and mechanical equipment when there is a flood risk;


5. The types of options available to the property owner to rent equipment after a weather emergency, a natural disaster event or pending the restoration of utility services;


6. The methods that the property owner may use to communicate with tenants during and after a weather emergency, a natural disaster event or a utility outage which is expected to last for more than twenty-four hours and suggestions for communicating to tenants relevant building contacts for emergencies; and


7. The contact information for relevant city agencies to determine evacuation guidelines or learn other suggestions on how to protect persons and property during a weather emergency, a natural disaster event or a utility outage which is expected to last for more than twenty-four hours.


§2.  Article 12 of subchapter 2 of chapter 2 of title 27 of the administrative code of the city of New York is amended by adding a new section 27-2051.1 to read as follows:

§27-2051.1 Temporary posting of emergency information.   Prior to the expectant arrival of a weather emergency, a natural disaster event or after being informed about a utility outage which is expected to last for more than twenty-four hours, the owner of a residential  dwelling where at least one dwelling unit is not occupied by such owner shall post the following information in common areas of the residential dwelling on signs of sufficient size to be seen: (i) whether the building is located in a hurricane evacuation zone as defined by the office of emergency management and if applicable, which zone the building is located in; (ii) the address of the nearest designated evacuation center; (iii) when a person should contact 911 and 311 during a weather  emergency, a natural disaster event or the utility outage; (iv) whether during the utility outage, services such as potable water, corridor, egress, and common area lighting, fire safety and fire protection, elevators, charging locations for cellular telephones, domestic hot water, or heating and cooling will be provided; (v) contact information for building personnel in the event of an emergency, including email addresses, phone numbers and other methods of communication; (vi) instructions on removing furniture from rooftops and balconies during high wind events and; (vii) for buildings that utilize pumps, instructions on reducing water consumption during the utility outage.  Such signs shall be updated by the owner of the residential building as needed and must be removed after the passage of the weather emergency, the natural disaster event or the restoration of utility services. The department shall determine the form of such signs including publishing a template that may be used by residential buildings for the purposes of this section. 

§3. This local law shall take effect one hundred eighty days after its enactment, except that the department of housing preservation and development shall take all necessary action, including the promulgation of rules, prior to such effective date.

10/22/2013 9:41 PM

THIS PAGE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK.

Proposed Int. No. 1089-A

By Council Members González, Chin, Comrie, James, Koo, Lander, Mendez, Richards and Rose

A LOCAL LAW

To amend the administrative code of the city of New York, the New York city building code and the New York city mechanical code, in relation to cabling for certain building systems and fuel-oil storage in flood-prone areas.

Be it enacted by the Council as follows:

Section 1. The administrative code of the city of New York is amended by adding a new section 27-3003.1 to read as follows:
§ 27-3003.1 Areas of special flood hazard and shaded X-Zones. Electrical work performed on structures located in areas of special flood hazard and shaded X-Zones, as defined in section G201.2 of the New York city building code, shall also comply with the provisions of appendix G of the New York city building code. Where, in any specific case, the provisions of this code conflict with the provisions of appendix G of the New York city building code, the more restrictive shall govern.

§2. The New York city amendments to subsection 770.48(A) of the National Electrical Code as set forth in section 27-3025 of the administrative code of the city of New York are REPEALED and new amendments are added to read as follows:

Subsection 770.48(A) – Revise subsection 770.48(A) to read as follows:

(A) Conductive and Nonconductive Cables. Unlisted conductive and nonconductive outside plant optical fiber cables shall be permitted to be installed in locations as described in 770.154(C), where the length of the cable within the building, measured from its point of entrance does not exceed 15 m (50 ft) and the cable enters the building from the outside and is terminated in an enclosure. All other cables shall be considered to be within the building.

Exception No. 1: In areas of special flood hazard, as defined in Section G201.2 of Appendix G of the New York City Building Code, the length of such cabling may exceed 15 m (50 ft) to the extent necessary to provide direct delivery to a level 1.52 m (5 ft) above the design flood elevation specified in Section 7.1 (Table 7-1) of Section G501.1 of Appendix G of the New York City Building Code, provided that:

(1) Such cabling shall not extend more than 3 m (10 ft) beyond the lowest story having its floor above the design flood elevation; and

(2) Such cabling shall not be installed in ducts used for environmental air or in plenums used for environmental air.

Exception No. 2: In areas designated within a shaded X-Zone, as defined in Section G201.2 of Appendix G of the New York City Building Code, the length of such cabling may exceed 15 m (50 ft) to the extent necessary to provide direct delivery to a level 1.52 m (5 ft) above the 500-year flood elevation, as defined in Section G201.2 of Appendix G of the New York City Building Code, provided that:

(1) Such cabling shall not extend more than 3 m (10 ft) beyond the lowest story having its floor above the design flood elevation; and

(2) Such cabling shall not be installed in ducts used for environmental air or in plenums used for environmental air.

FPN No. 1: Splice cases or terminal boxes, both metallic and plastic types, typically are used as enclosures for splicing or terminating optical fiber cables.

FPN No. 2: See 770.2 for the definition of Point of Entrance.


§3. Section 27-3025 of the administrative code of the city of New York is amended by adding a new New York city amendment to section 800.48 of the National Electrical Code to read as follows:

SECTION 800.48

Section 800.48 – Add two exceptions to the end of section 800.48 to read as follows:

Exception No. 1: In areas of special flood hazard, as defined in Section G201.2 of Appendix G of the New York City Building Code, the length of such cabling may exceed 15 m (50 ft) to the extent necessary to provide direct delivery to a level 1.52 m (5 ft) above the design flood elevation specified in Section 7.1 (Table 7-1) of Section G501.1 of Appendix G of the New York City Building Code, provided that:

(1) Such cabling shall not extend more than 3 m (10 ft) beyond the lowest story having its floor above the design flood elevation; and

(2) Such cabling shall not be installed in ducts used for environmental air or in plenums used for environmental air.

Exception No. 2: In areas designated within a shaded X-Zone, as defined in Section G201.2 of Appendix G of the New York City Building Code, the length of such cabling may exceed 15 m (50 ft) to the extent necessary to provide direct delivery to a level 1.52 m (5 ft) above the 500-year flood elevation, as defined in Section G201.2 of Appendix G of the New York City Building Code, provided that:

(1) Such cabling shall not extend more than 3 m (10 ft) beyond the lowest story having its floor above the design flood elevation; and

(2) Such cabling shall not be installed in ducts used for environmental air or in plenums used for environmental air.

§4. Section BC 202 of the New York city building code is amended by adding new definitions of “500-YEAR FLOOD ELEVATION” and “SHADED X-ZONE” in appropriate alphabetical order to read as follows:

500-YEAR FLOOD ELEVATION. See Section G201.2.

SHADED X-ZONE. See Section G201.2.

§5. Section G102.1 of the New York city building code, as added by local law number 33 of the year 2007, is amended to read as follows:

G102.1 General. This appendix, in conjunction with the New York City Construction Codes, provides minimum requirements for development located, in whole or in part, in areas of special flood hazard and shaded X-Zones within the jurisdiction of New York City, including:

§6. Appendix G of the New York city building code is amended by adding a new section G103.3.1 to read as follows:

G103.3.1 Determination of 500-year flood elevations. Where 500-year flood elevations are not specified in the FEMA FIRMs 360497 or FEMA FIS 360497, such elevations shall be determined by a registered design professional using modeling based on generally accepted engineering methods or a review of available data from city, state and federal agencies.

§7. Section G201.2 of the New York city building code is amended by adding new definitions of “500-YEAR FLOOD ELEVATION” and “SHADED X-ZONE” in appropriate alphabetical order to read as follows: 
500-YEAR FLOOD ELEVATION. The elevation of the flood having a 0.2-percent chance of being equaled or exceeded in any given year, as specified on FEMA FIRM 360497 or FEMA FIS 360497.

SHADED X-ZONE. The land in the floodplain delineated as subject to a 0.2-percent or greater chance of flooding, but less than one percent chance of flooding, in any given year. Such areas are designated on the Flood Insurance Rate Map (FIRM) as shaded X-Zones.

§8. Appendix G of the New York city building code is amended by adding a new section G307.4 to read as follows:

G307.4 Additional fuel-oil storage capacity. Fuel-oil storage capacity in areas of special flood hazard and shaded X-Zones shall comply with the following:
1. In areas of special flood hazard, fuel oil on the lowest story having its floor above the applicable design flood elevation shall be limited to 3,000 gallons (11 356 L) and no storage tank may exceed the lesser of 1,500 gallons (5678 L) or the quantity of fuel-oil needed to operate the emergency or standby generator(s) served by such tank for 24 hours and

2. In shaded X-Zones, fuel oil on the lowest story having its floor above the 500-year flood elevation shall be limited to 3,000 gallons (11 356 L) and no storage tank may exceed the lesser of 1,500 gallons (5678 L) or the quantity of fuel-oil needed to operate the emergency or standby generator(s) served by such tank for 24 hours.

G307.4.1 Additional requirements. Where fuel-oil storage capacity exceeds the quantity set forth in Section 1305.11.1.3 of the New York City Mechanical Code, the fuel-oil storage shall comply with Sections G307.4.1.1 and G307.4.1.2 in addition to Section 1305 of the New York City Mechanical Code.

G307.4.1.1 Vault. Each fuel-oil storage tank shall be separately enclosed in a vault complying with the following requirements:

1. The walls, floor, and top of such vault shall have a fire resistance rating of not less than 3 hours;

2. The walls of such vault shall be bonded to the floor of such vault;

3. The top and walls of such vault shall be independent of the building structure;

4. An exterior building wall having a fire resistance rating of not less than 3 hours shall be permitted to serve as a wall of such vault and

5. The vault shall be located in a dedicated room or area of the building that is separated vertically and horizontally from other areas of the building by construction having a fire resistance rating of not less than 2 hours.

G307.4.1.2 Extinguishing system. Fuel-oil storage shall be protected with an alternative automatic fire-extinguishing system complying with Section 904.

§9. Section 1305.11.1.3 of the New York city mechanical code, as added by local law number 33 for the year 2007, is amended to read as follows:

1305.11.1.3 Inside of buildings; above the lower floor. Fuel-oil above the lowest floor inside of a building shall be limited to 330 gallons (1249 L) per story. The maximum quantity shall include oversized piping as described in 1305.9.12. Piping installations shall comply with the requirements of Section 1305.9.

Exception: Fuel-oil storage capacity in areas of special flood hazard and shaded X-Zones, as defined in Section G201.2 of Appendix G of the New York City Building Code, shall comply with Section G307.4 of Appendix G of the New York City Building Code.


§10. This local law shall take effect immediately.

10/28/2013 4:54PM

THIS PAGE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK.
Proposed Int. No. 1096-A

By Council Members Oddo, Chin, Comrie, Dickens, Fidler, James, Koo, Lander, Mendez, Recchia, Richards and Rose

A LOCAL LAW

To amend the New York city building code, the New York city mechanical code and the New York city fire code, in relation to relocating and protecting building systems in flood-prone areas.

Be it enacted by the Council as follows:

Section 1. Section G304.1.1 of the New York city building code is amended by adding new items 5.1, 5.2, 5.3 and 5.4 to read as follows:

5.1 Fire protection systems and equipment. The following fire protection systems and equipment shall be located at or above the design flood elevation specified in ASCE 24, Table 7-1, except that where the system or equipment or portion thereof serves only spaces located below such design flood elevation, the system or equipment or portion thereof may be located at or above such design flood elevation:

5.1.1. Sprinkler control valves that are not outside stem and yoke valves;

5.1.2. Fire standpipe control valves that are not outside stem and yoke valves;

5.1.3. Sprinkler booster pumps and fire pumps;

5.1.4. Dry pipe valve-related electrically operated alarm appurtenances;

5.1.5. Alarm control panels for water and non-water fire extinguishing systems;

5.1.6. Alarm control panels for sprinkler systems, pre-action sprinkler systems, deluge sprinkler systems, and combined dry pipe and pre-action sprinkler systems;

5.1.7. Electrically operated waterflow detection devices serving sprinkler systems and

5.1.8. Air compressors serving sprinkler systems and pre-action sprinkler systems.

5.2 Fire alarm systems and components. Where a zoning indicator panel is provided at the main building entrance in accordance with Section 907.6.3.1 and such panel is located at or below 5 feet (1524 mm) above the design flood elevation specified in ASCE 24, Table 7-1, at least one secondary zoning indicator panel complying with the following requirements shall be provided:

5.2.1. The secondary zoning indicator panel, associated controls, power supplies and means of transferring control shall be provided at least 5 feet (1524 mm) above the design flood elevation specified in ASCE 24, Table 7-1, in a location accessible to responding Fire Department personnel and approved by the department and the Fire Department and

5.2.2. Where the secondary zoning indicator panel or associated controls are only operable upon transfer of control from another zoning indicator panel, such transfer shall be by a means that is approved by the Fire Department.

5.3 Fuel-oil piping systems. The following requirements shall apply to fuel-oil piping systems, as defined by Section 202 of the New York City Mechanical Code: 

5.3.1 Fill piping that does not terminate in a watertight terminal approved by the department shall terminate at least 3 feet (914 mm) above the design flood elevation specified in ASCE 24, Table 7-1 and

5.3.2 Normal vent piping and emergency vent piping shall terminate at least 3 feet (914 mm) above the design flood elevation specified in ASCE 24, Table 7-1.

5.4 Plumbing systems and components. The structure shall comply with the following requirements:

5.4.1 Relief vents and fresh air intakes. Relief vents and fresh air intakes serving building traps in accordance with Section 1002.6 of the New York City Plumbing Code shall be carried above grade and shall terminate in a screened outlet that is located outside of the building and at or above the design flood elevation specified in ASCE 24, Table 7-1 and

5.4.2 Reduced pressure zone backflow preventers. Reduced pressure principle backflow preventers complying with Section 608.13.2 of the New York City Plumbing Code and backflow preventers with intermediate atmospheric vents complying with Section 608.13.3 of the New York City Plumbing Code shall be located at or above the design flood elevation specified in ASCE 24, Table 7-1.


§2. Section G304.1.2 of the New York city building code is amended by adding a new item 2.3.1 to read as follows:

2.3.1 Additional requirements. The structure shall comply with Items 5.1 through 5.4 of Section G304.1.1.

§3. Section G304.2 of the New York city building code is amended by adding a new item 5.1 to read as follows:

5.1 Additional requirements. The structure shall comply with Items 5.1 through 5.4 of Section G304.1.1.

§4. Appendix G of the New York city building code is amended by adding a new section G304.4 to read as follows:

G304.4 Construction standards for shaded X-Zones. In shaded X-Zones, buildings that include I-2 occupancies that are hospitals shall comply with the requirements of this chapter and the applicable provisions of ASCE 24 for A-Zone construction.

§5. Appendix G of the New York city building code is amended by adding a new section G307.5 to read as follows:

G307.5 Elevation of certain tanks and containers serving critical facilities. The following tanks and containers shall be located at or above the design flood elevation specified in ASCE 24, Table 7-1, unless such tanks and containers serve buildings that include I-2 occupancies that are hospitals, in which case such tanks and containers shall be located at or above the greater of (i) the design flood elevation specified in ASCE 24, Table 7-1, or (ii) the 500-year flood elevation. Such tanks and containers must be designed to maintain service to such structure during flood conditions and shall comply with section 9.6 of ASCE 24:
 

1. Medical and compressed gas storage tanks, oxygen tanks, and other cryogenic system storage tanks;
 

2. Hazardous material storage tanks;
 

3. Stationary compressed gas containers;
 

4. Stationary cryogenic containers and
 

5. Stationary flammable gas storage containers.
§6. Table 2-1 of Section 2.3, Table 4-1 of Section 4.4, Table 5-1 of Section 5.1, Table 6-1 of Section 6.2 and Table 7-1 of Section 7.1 of ASCE 24 as modified by section G501.1 of the New York city building code, as amended by a local law of the city of New York for the year 2013 amending the administrative code of the city of New York, the New York city plumbing code, the New York city building code, the New York city mechanical code and the New York city fuel gas code, relating to bringing such codes up to date with the 2009 editions of the international building, mechanical, fuel gas and plumbing codes, as proposed in introduction number 1056, are amended to read as follows: 

TABLE 2-1
MINIMUM ELEVATION OF THE TOP OF LOWEST FLOOR
RELATIVE TO DESIGN FLOOD ELEVATION (DFE)—A-ZONESa
	STRUCTURAL OCCUPANCY
CATEGORYb
	MINIMUM ELEVATION OF
LOWEST FLOOR

	I
	DFE=BFE

	II (1- and 2-family dwellings)
	DFE=BFE+ 2 ft

	IIc, d (all others)
	DFE=BFE+ 1 ft

	IIIc, d
	DFE=BFE+ 1 ft

	IVc, d
	DFE=BFE+ 2 ft


a. 
Minimum elevations shown in Table 2-1 do not apply to V Zones (see Table 4-1). Minimum elevations shown in Table 2-1 apply to A-Zones unless spe​cific elevation requirements are given in Section 3 of this standard.

b. 
See Table 1-1 or Table 1604.5 of the New York City Building Code, for structural occupancy category descriptions.  

c. 
For nonresidential buildings and nonresidential portions of mixed-use buildings, the lowest floor shall be allowed below the minimum elevation if the structure meets the floodproofing requirements of Section 6.

d.
Buildings that include I-2 occupancies that are hospitals shall use the greater of (i) the DFE for the applicable structural occupancy category as indicated in this table or (ii) the 500-year flood elevation.
TABLE 4-1
MINIMUM ELEVATION OF BOTTOM OF LOWEST SUPPORTING
HORIZONTAL STRUCTURAL MEMBER OF LOWEST FLOOR
RELATIVE TO DESIGN FLOOD ELEVATION (DFE)—V-ZONES AND COASTAL A-ZONES 

	STRUCTURAL
OCCUPANCY
CATEGORYa
	MEMBER ORIENTATION RELATIVE TO THE
DIRECTION OF WAVE APPROACH

	
	Parallelb
	Perpendicularb

	I
	DFE=BFE
	DFE=BFE

	II (1-and 2- family dwellings)
	DFE=BFE[ ]+ 2 ft
	DFE=BFE[ ]+ 2 ft

	IIc (all others)
	DFE=BFE
	DFE=BFE+ 1 ft

	IIIc
	DFE=BFE+ 1 ft
	DFE=BFE+ 2 ft

	IVc
	DFE=BFE+ 1 ft
	DFE=BFE+ 2 ft


a.
See Table 1-1, or Table 1604.5 of the New York City Building Code, for structural occupancy category descriptions. 
b.
Orientation of lowest horizontal structural member relative to the general direction of wave approach; parallel shall mean less than or equal to +20 degrees from the direction of approach; perpendicular shall mean greater than +20 degrees from the direction of approach.

c.
Buildings that include I-2 occupancies that are hospitals shall use the greater of (i) the DFE for the applicable structural occupancy category as indicated in this table or (ii) the 500-year flood elevation.
TABLE 5-1
MINIMUM ELEVATION, RELATIVE TO DESIGN FLOOD
ELEVATION (DFE), BELOW WHICH FLOOD-DAMAGE-RESISTANT
MATERIALS SHALL BE USED

	STRUCTURAL
OCCUPANCY
CATEGORYa
	A-ZONE
	Coastal High Hazard Areas and Coastal A-Zones

	
	
	Orientation
Parallelb
	Orientation
Perpendicularb

	I
	DFE=BFE
	DFE=BFE
	DFE=BFE

	II (1-and 2- family dwellings)
	DFE=BFE+ 2 ft
	DFE=BFE+ 2 ft
	DFE=BFE+ 2 ft

	IIc (all others)
	DFE=BFE+ 1 ft
	DFE=BFE+ 1 ft
	DFE=BFE+ 2 ft

	IIIc
	DFE=BFE+ 1 ft
	DFE=BFE+ 2 ft
	DFE=BFE+ 3 ft

	IVc
	DFE=BFE+ 2 ft
	DFE=BFE+ 2 ft
	DFE=BFE+ 3 ft


a. See Table 1-1, or Table 1604.5 of the New York City Building Code, for struc​tural occupancy category descriptions.

b. Orientation of lowest horizontal structural member relative to the general direction of wave approach; parallel shall mean less than or equal to +20 degrees from the direction of approach; perpendicular shall mean greater than +20 degrees from the direction of approach.

c.
Buildings that include I-2 occupancies that are hospitals shall use the greater of (i) the DFE for the applicable structural occupancy category as indicated in this table or (ii) the 500-year flood elevation.
TABLE 6-1
MINIMUM ELEVATION OF FLOODPROOFING, RELATIVE TO
DESIGN FLOOD ELEVATION (DFE)—A-ZONES

	STRUCTURAL
OCCUPANCY CATEGORYa
	MINIMUM ELEVATION OF
FLOODPROOFINGb

	I
	DFE=BFE+ 1 ft

	IIc, d
	DFE=BFE+ 1 ft

	IIId
	DFE=BFE+ 1 ft

	IVd
	DFE=BFE+ 2 ft


a. See Table 1-1, or Table 1604.5 of the New York City Building Code, for struc​tural occupancy category descriptions.

b. Wet or dry floodproofing shall extend to the same level. 
c. Dry floodproofing of residential buildings and residential portions of mixed use buildings shall not be permitted.

d.
Buildings that include I-2 occupancies that are hospitals shall use the greater of (i) the DFE for the applicable structural occupancy category as indicated in this table or (ii) the 500-year flood elevation.
TABLE 7-1
MINIMUM ELEVATION OF UTILITIES AND ATTENDANT EQUIPMENT RELATIVE TO DESIGN FLOOD ELEVATION (DFE)

	STRUCTURAL OCCUPANCY CATEGORYa
	LOCATE UTILITIES AND ATTENDANT EQUIPMENT ABOVEb

	
	A-Zones
	 Coastal High Hazard Area and Coastal A-Zones

	
	
	Orientation Parallelc
	Orientation Perpendicularc

	I
	DFE=BFE
	DFE=BFE
	DFE=BFE

	II (1-and 2- family dwellings)
	DFE=BFE+ 2 ft
	DFE=BFE+ 2 ft
	DFE=BFE+ 2 ft

	IIc, d (all others)
	DFE=BFE+ 1 ft
	DFE=BFE+ 1 ft
	DFE=BFE+ 2 ft

	IIId
	DFE=BFE+ 1 ft
	DFE=BFE+ 2 ft
	DFE=BFE+ 3 ft

	IVd
	DFE=BFE+ 2 ft
	DFE=BFE+ 2 ft
	DFE=BFE+ 3 ft


a. See Table 1-1, or Table 1604.5 of the New York City Building Code, for structural occupancy category descriptions.

b. Locate utilities and attendant equipment above elevations shown unless otherwise provided in the text.

c. Orientation of lowest horizontal structural member relative to the general direction of  wave approach; parallel shall mean less than or equal to +20 degrees from the direction of approach; perpendicular shall mean greater than +20 degrees from the direction of approach.
d.
Buildings that include I-2 occupancies that are hospitals shall use the greater of (i) the DFE for the applicable structural occupancy category as indicated in this table or (ii) the 500-year flood elevation.
§7. Section G501.1 of the New York city building code is amended by adding a new modification to section 7.2.4 of ASCE 24 to read as follows:

Section 7.2.4. Section 7.2.4 (Disconnect Switches and Circuit Breakers) is amended to read as follows:

7.2.4 Disconnect Switches and Circuit Breakers. The main disconnect switch, all service disconnecting means, and all circuit breakers shall be located above and be accessible from the elevation specified in Table 7-1. Switches, all service disconnecting means, and circuit breakers shall be located no more than 6 feet 7 inches (2 m) above the floor, or a platform shall be installed to provide access.

§8. The modification to section 23.2.2.4(c) of NFPA 13 set forth in section Q102.1 of Appendix Q of the New York city building code, as amended by a local law of the city of New York for the year 2013 amending the administrative code of the city of New York, the New York city plumbing code, the New York city building code, the New York city mechanical code and the New York city fuel gas code, relating to bringing such codes up to date with the 2009 editions of the international building, mechanical, fuel gas and plumbing codes, as proposed in introduction number 1056, is amended to read as follows:

(c) Such pumps shall also comply with the applicable provisions of this Referenced Standard and the New York City Building Code pertaining to Fire Pumps, except that only one water supply [and no enclosure] shall be required.

§9. The modification to section 9.1.5(2)(f) of NFPA 14 set forth in section Q105.1 of Appendix Q of the New York city building code, as amended by a local law of the city of New York for the year 2013 amending the administrative code of the city of New York, the New York city plumbing code, the New York city building code, the New York city mechanical code and the New York city fuel gas code, relating to bringing such codes up to date with the 2009 editions of the international building, mechanical, fuel gas and plumbing codes, as proposed in introduction number 1056, is amended to read as follows:

(f) Fire pumps shall be placed on concrete pads at least 12 in. (305mm) above the pump room floor with a clearance of at least 3 ft. (914 mm) maintained on all sides from walls or from other equipment in the pump room. In the event of the use of a vertical shaft centrifugal fire pump, the 12 in. (305 mm) high concrete pad may be omitted, provided the bottom of the electric driving motor and all electrical appurtenances are raised at least 12 in. (305 mm) above the pump room floor. Fire pumps shall be located in a 2-hour fire-rated enclosure. 

§10. Section 301.13 of the New York city mechanical code, as added by local law number 33 for the year 2007, is amended to read as follows:

301.13 Flood hazard. For structures located in areas of special flood hazard, and buildings that include I-2 occupancies that are hospitals located in shaded X-Zones, mechanical systems, equipment and appliances shall comply with Appendix G of the New York City Building Code.


§11. The New York city fire code is amended by adding a new section 904.3.6 to read as follows:

904.3.6 Flood hazard. Non-water fire extinguishing system control panels located in areas of special flood hazard or on the premises of Group I-2 occupancies that are hospitals located in shaded X-Zones (as defined in Section G201.2 of Appendix G of the Building Code) shall be located at or above the design flood elevation in accordance with Appendix G of the Building Code.

§12. Section 2703.2.4 of chapter 27 the New York city fire code, as added by local law number 26 for the year 2008, is amended to read as follows:

2703.2.4 Installation of tanks. Installation of tanks shall be in accordance with Sections 2703.2.4.1 through [2703.2.4.2.1] 2703.2.4.3 and with the regulations of the New York State Department of Environmental Conservation as set forth in 6 NYCRR Sections 599.6, 614.7 and 614.13.

2703.2.4.1 Underground tanks. Underground tanks used for the storage of liquid hazardous materials shall be provided with secondary containment.

2703.2.4.2 Aboveground tanks. Aboveground stationary tanks used for the storage of liquid hazardous materials shall be located and protected in compliance with the requirements for outdoor storage of the particular material involved.

2703.2.4.2.1 Marking. Aboveground stationary tanks shall be marked as required by Section 2703.5.

2703.2.4.3 Flood hazard. Hazardous material storage tanks located in areas of special flood hazard or on the premises of Group I-2 occupancies that are hospitals located in shaded X-Zones (as defined in Section G201.2 of the Building Code) shall comply with Section G307.5 of Appendix G of the Building Code.

§13. Section 3003.3.1 of chapter 33 of the New York city fire code, as added by local law number 26 for the year 2008, is amended to read as follows:

3003.3.1 [Reserved.] Flood hazard. Stationary compressed gas containers located in areas of special flood hazard or on the premises of Group I-2 occupancies that are hospitals located in shaded X-Zones (as defined in Section G201.2 of Appendix G of the Building Code) shall comply with Section G307.5 of the Building Code.

§14. Section 3203.1.2 of chapter 32 of the New York city fire code, as added by local law number 26 for the year 2008, is amended to read as follows:

3203.1.2 [Reserved.] Flood hazard. Stationary cryogenic containers located in areas of special flood hazard or on the premises of Group I-2 occupancies that are hospitals located in shaded X-Zones (as defined in Section G201.2 of Appendix G of the Building Code) shall comply with Section G307.5 of the Building Code.

§15. The New York city fire code is amended by adding a new section 3501.5 to read as follows:
3501.5 Flood hazard. Stationary flammable gas containers located in areas of special flood hazard or on the premises of Group I-2 occupancies that are hospitals located in shaded X-Zones (as defined in Section G201.2 of Appendix G of the Building Code) shall comply with Section G307.5 of the Building Code.
§16. This local law shall take effect on the same date that a local law of the city of New York for the year 2013 amending the administrative code of the city of New York, the New York city plumbing code, the New York city building code, the New York city mechanical code and the New York city fuel gas code, relating to bringing such codes up to date with the 2009 editions of the international building, mechanical, fuel gas and plumbing codes, as proposed in introduction number 1056, takes effect.

10/29/13 6:01PM
THIS PAGE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK.
Proposed Int. No. 1099-A

By Council Members Richards, Chin, James, Koo, Lander, Mendez, Recchia, Rose, Barron, and Van Bramer

A LOCAL LAW

To amend the New York city building code and the New York city mechanical code, in relation to preventing wind damage to certain buildings and systems.

Be it enacted by the Council as follows:

Section 1. Section 1609.1.2 of the New York city building code, as amended by a local law of the city of New York for the year 2013 amending the administrative code of the city of New York, the New York city plumbing code, the New York city building code, the New York city mechanical code and the New York city fuel gas code, relating to bringing such codes up to date with the 2009 editions of the international building, mechanical, fuel gas and plumbing codes, as proposed in Intro. 1056, is amended to read as follows:


1609.1.2 [Reserved.] Protection from wind borne debris. The following buildings shall be protected with an impact-resistant covering or glazing in accordance with the Missile Levels and Wind Zones specified in ASTM E1886 and ASTM E1996 or other approved test methods and performance criteria:

1. Buildings in Structural Occupancy Category IV, as defined in Table 1604.5, located in Exposure C or D, as defined in Section 1609.4; 

2. Buildings in Structural Occupancy Category III, as defined in Table 1604.5, located in Exposure D, as defined in Section 1609.4, where the glazing of such building encloses places of assembly for 300 or more persons or areas of in-place shelter. 

Exception: Glazing protection in accordance with Section 1609.1.2 shall not be required if the glazing is located more than 60 feet (18 288 mm) above the ground and more than 30 feet (9144 mm) above aggregate-surfaced roofs, including roofs with gravel or stone ballast located within 1,500 feet (457.2 m) of the building. 

1609.1.2.1 Louvers. Louvers protecting intake and exhaust ventilation ducts not assumed to be open that are located within 30 feet (9144 mm) of grade shall meet the requirements of an approved impact-resisting standard or the large missile test of ASTM E 1996.

1609.1.2.2 Garage doors. Garage door glazed opening protection for wind-borne debris shall meet the requirements of an approved impact-resisting standard or ANSI/DASMA 115.
§ 2. Chapter 4 of the New York city mechanical code, as amended by a local law of the city of New York for the year 2013 amending the administrative code of the city of New York, the New York city plumbing code, the New York city building code, the New York city mechanical code and the New York city fuel gas code, relating to bringing such codes up to date with the 2009 editions of the international building, mechanical, fuel gas and plumbing codes, as proposed in Intro. 1056, is amended by adding a new section 401.6.1 to read as follows:

401.6.1 Wind-driven rain rating. All exterior louvers for building ventilation systems shall either:

1. Receive an A rating according to AMCA Standard 550 for wind-driven rain penetration for a 50 mile per hour (80.4 km/h) wind velocity with a rainfall rate of eight inches (203 mm) per hour; or

2. Be installed on a plenum configured to intercept any wind-driven rain penetrating the louver and to prevent the rain from entering the building ductwork system. Such plenum shall be waterproofed and equipped with a drainage system to convey water penetrating the louver to storm or sanitary drains. 

§ 3. Chapter 5 of the New York city mechanical code, as amended by a local law of the city of New York for the year 2013 amending the administrative code of the city of New York, the New York city plumbing code, the New York city building code, the New York city mechanical code and the New York city fuel gas code, relating to bringing such codes up to date with the 2009 editions of the international building, mechanical, fuel gas and plumbing codes, as proposed in Intro. 1056, is amended by adding a new section 501.2.2.1 to read as follows:

501.2.2.1 Wind-driven rain rating. All exterior louvers for building exhaust systems shall either:

1. Receive an A rating according to AMCA Standard 550 for wind-driven rain penetration for a 50 mile per hour (80.4 km/h) wind velocity with a rainfall rate of eight inches (203 mm) per hour; or

2. Be installed on a plenum configured to intercept any wind-driven rain penetrating the louver and to prevent the rain from entering the building ductwork system. Such plenum shall be waterproofed and equipped with a drainage system to convey water penetrating the louver to storm or sanitary drains.

§ 4. Chapter 35 of the New York city building code, as amended by a local law of the city of New York for the year 2013 amending the administrative code of the city of New York, the New York city plumbing code, the New York city building code, the New York city mechanical code and the New York city fuel gas code, relating to bringing such codes up to date with the 2009 editions of the international building, mechanical, fuel gas and plumbing codes, as proposed in Intro. 1056, is amended by adding new reference standards ASTM E 1886, ASTM E 1996, and ANSI/DASMA 115 to read as follows:

	ASTM
	ASTM International

100 Barr Harbor Drive

West Conshohocken, PA 19428-2959

	Standard 

Reference 

Number
	Title
	Referenced 

in code

section number

	E 1886—06
	Standard Test Method for Performance of Exterior Windows, Curtain Walls, Doors, and Impact Protective Systems Impacted by Missile(s) and Exposed to Cyclic Pressure Differentials
	1609.1.2

	
	
	

	E 1996—09
	Standard Specification for Performance of Exterior Windows, Curtain Walls, Doors, and Impact Protective Systems Impacted by Windborne Debris in Hurricanes
	1609.1.2,

1609.1.2.1


	DASMA 
	Door and Access Systems Manufacturers Association International
1300 Summer Avenue
Cleveland, OH 44115-2851

	Standard
reference
number
	Title
	Referenced
in code
section number

	115-05
	Standard Method for Testing Sectional Garage Doors and Rolling Doors: Determination of Structural Performance Under Missile Impact and Cyclic Wind Pressure
	1609.1.2.2


§ 5. Chapter 15 of the New York city mechanical code, as amended by a local law of the city of New York for the year 2013 amending the administrative code of the city of New York, the New York city plumbing code, the New York city building code, the New York city mechanical code and the New York city fuel gas code, relating to bringing such codes up to date with the 2009 editions of the international building, mechanical, fuel gas and plumbing codes, as proposed in Intro. 1056, is amended by adding new reference standard AMCA 550 as follows:

	AMCA
	Air Movement and Control Association International 
30 West University Drive 
Arlington Heights, IL 60004 

	Standard 
Reference 
Number 
	Title
	Referenced 
in code 
section number 

	550—09 
	Test Method for High Velocity Wind Driven Rain Resistant Louvers 
	401.6.1, 501.2.2.1 


§ 6. This local law shall take effect on the same date as a local law of the city of New York for the year 2013 amending the administrative code of the city of New York, the New York city plumbing code, the New York city building code, the New York city mechanical code and the New York city fuel gas code, relating to bringing such codes up to date with the 2009 editions of the international building, mechanical, fuel gas and plumbing codes, as proposed in Intro. 1056, takes effect.

JCH
10/22/2013 8:53 PM



� Hurricane Sandy Advisory Archive, National Oceanic and Atmospheric Administration Hurricane Center, available online at � HYPERLINK "http://www.nhc.noaa.gov/archive/2012/SANDY.shtml" �http://www.nhc.noaa.gov/archive/2012/SANDY.shtml�; Hurricane Sandy After Action Plan (May 2013), pg. 4, available online at � HYPERLINK "http://www.nyc.gov/html/recovery/downloads/pdf/sandy_aar_5.2.13.pdf" �http://www.nyc.gov/html/recovery/downloads/pdf/sandy_aar_5.2.13.pdf�; Special Initiative for Rebuilding and Resiliency report, pgs. 11-18, available online at: � HYPERLINK "http://nytelecom.vo.llnwd.net/o15/agencies/sirr/SIRR_spreads_Lo_Res.pdf" �http://nytelecom.vo.llnwd.net/o15/agencies/sirr/SIRR_spreads_Lo_Res.pdf�.


� SIRR report, pg. 5; After Action Plan, pg. 1. 


� SIRR report, pg. 34.


� Mireya Navarro, “After Storm, Dry Floors Prove Value of Exceeding City Code,” New York Times (Nov. 23, 2012), available online at � HYPERLINK "http://www.nytimes.com/2012/11/24/science/earth/new-york-reassessing-building-code-to-limit-storm-damage.html?_r=0" �http://www.nytimes.com/2012/11/24/science/earth/new-york-reassessing-building-code-to-limit-storm-damage.html?_r=0�.


� BRTF report, pg. 4, available online at � HYPERLINK "http://www.urbangreencouncil.org/BuildingResiliency" �http://www.urbangreencouncil.org/BuildingResiliency�.


� BRTF report, pg. 5.


� See BC §§ G102.1 and G304.


� See 2008 Building Code (“BC”) § G201.2.


� SIRR website, “FEMA Flood Map Update,” available online at � HYPERLINK "http://www.nyc.gov/html/sirr/html/map/flood_map_update.shtml" �http://www.nyc.gov/html/sirr/html/map/flood_map_update.shtml�.


� Id.


� Id.


� See id. and FEMA, “Adoption of Flood Insurance Rate Maps by Participating Communities,” available online at � HYPERLINK "http://www.fema.gov/media-library-data/20130726-1903-25045-4716/fema_495.pdf" �http://www.fema.gov/media-library-data/20130726-1903-25045-4716/fema_495.pdf�.


� Id.


� Such areas are already required to be elevated for new or substantially improved residential buildings located in flood-prone areas. See BC 304.1.1.


� Occupancy Group I-2 spaces are “used for medical, surgical, psychiatric, nursing or personal care on a 24-hour basis or overnight of more than two children under the age of 2, or more than three persons who are not capable of self-preservation and not capable of responding to an emergency situation without physical assistance from staff.” BC 308.3. The group includes adult homes (where occupants are not capable of self-preservation), community residences or intermediate care facilities (where occupants are not capable of self-preservation), enriched housing  (where occupants are not capable of self-preservation), hospitals, nursing homes, mental hospitals where patients are not under restraint, and detoxification facilities. Id.


� These services are identified by reference to 10 NYCRR § 703.6(c)(2)(i) as “services that require specialized equipment such as radiographic equipment, computerized axial tomography, magnetic resonance imaging or that [are] required for renal dialysis.”


� Section 1305.11.1.3 of the Mechanical Code provides that fuel-oil stored above the “lowest floor inside of a building shall be limited to 330 gallons (1249 L) per story.”


� A-Zones are areas of special flood hazard without high velocity wave action. BC § G201.2.





Page 28 of 28

