Staff:
Robert C. Calandra








Counsel to the Committee









William Hongach








Legislative Policy Analyst









Regina Poreda Ryan









Deputy Director, Finance 

[image: image1.png]



THE COUNCIL
REPORT OF THE GOVERNMENTAL AFFAIRS DIVISION

Robert Newman, Legislative Director

Alix Pustilnik, Deputy Director, Governmental Affairs

COMMITTEE ON FIRE AND CRIMINAL JUSTICE SERVICES
Elizabeth S. Crowley, Chair

December 19, 2013
PROPOSED INT. NO. 1174-A:
By Council Members Crowley, Koo, Koppell, Vann and Halloran (by request of the Mayor)

TITLE:
A Local Law to amend the New York city fire code, in relation to the enhancement of emergency preparedness in New York city and the adoption of current fire safety standards as incorporated in the 2009 edition of the international fire code, and to amend certain provisions of the New York city charter, the New York city mechanical code and the New York city plumbing code consistent with amendments to the New York city fire code.

CHARTER:
Amends paragraphs l, m, n and o of subdivision 2 of section 1301 of the New York city charter, as added by local law number 61 for the year 1991 and amended by local law number 26 for the year 2008. Amends subdivision g of section 487 of the New York city charter, as added by local law number 26 for the year 2008.
PLUMBING CODE:
Amends chapter 4 of the New York city plumbing code of chapter 6 of title 28 of the administrative code of the city of New York, as added by local law number 99 for the year 2005, amended by local law numbers 54 and 55 for the year 2010, and amended by local law number 41 for the year of 2012, by adding a new section 429:

MECHANICAL CODE:
Amends section 507.16 of the New York city mechanical code of chapter 8 of title 28 of the administrative code of the city of New York, as added by local law number 33 for the year 2007.
FIRE CODE:
Amends chapters 1 through 45 and appendices A and B of the New York city fire code, chapter 2 of title 29 of the administrative code of the city of New York, as added by local law number 26 for the year 2008, amended by local law numbers 37, 39, 41 and 64 for the year 2009, and amended by local law 2 for the year 2013.

I.     BACKGROUND
On December 19, 2013, the Committee on Fire and Criminal Justice Services (“the Committee”), chaired by Council Member Elizabeth S. Crowley, will vote on Proposed Int. No. 1174-A, “A Local Law to amend the New York city fire code, in relation to the enhancement of emergency preparedness in New York city and the adoption of current fire safety standards as incorporated in the 2009 edition of the international fire code, and to amend certain provisions of the New York city charter, the New York city mechanical code and the New York city plumbing code consistent with amendments to the New York city fire code.” The Committee previously considered this legislation on November 21, 2013 and received testimony from the New York City Fire Department and other interested parties. The Fire Department held a public forum on the proposed code revision on August 14, 2013.
In 2008, the Council passed Local Law No. 26 of that year, which enacted a new Fire Code for New York City effective July 1, 2008. The new Fire Code was based on the 2003 edition of the International Fire Code (“IFC”), the model fire code published by the International Code Council (“ICC”), amended to reflect New York City’s unique character and existing fire safety standards and requirements. The new Fire Code requires that no later than the third year after the effective date of the new Fire Code and every third year thereafter, the Fire Commissioner review the latest edition of the IFC and submit proposed amendments to the City Council that the Commissioner determines should be made to the Fire Code based upon such model code. In accordance with this requirement, the Fire Department undertook a three-year code review process in consultation with representatives of the New York City Department of Buildings and industry, professional, trade and union organizations as well as the City Council. Proposed  Int. No. 1174-A reflects proposed amendments to the Fire Code based on the 2006 and 2009 editions of the IFC, and certain portions of the 2012 IFC, as well as local initiatives.
Today, the Committee will vote on Proposed Int. No. 1174-A which includes amendments to Int. No. 1174 that were made subsequent to the November 21st hearing, detailed below.
II.     INTENT OF PROPOSED INT. NO. 1174-A
According to the legislative intent section of Proposed Int. No. 1174-A, “This local law amends the New York city fire code to incorporate new fire safety standards and technologies adopted or reflected in the international fire code since the 2003 edition that was the basis for the 2008 New York city fire code. The fire code amendments enacted by this local law also reflect an evolution in thinking about the implementation of emergency preparedness requirements in a wide range of business, commercial and institutional occupancies.  New emergency preparedness requirements address non-fire emergencies and coordinate plan, staffing and voice communication capabilities.  These amendments will fulfill the goal of local law 26 of keeping the New York city fire code current and relevant to the fire safety challenges facing New York city.”
III. HIGHLIGHTS OF PROPOSED INT. NO. 1174-A
The Administration listed several significant highlights of the proposed Fire Code in their Memorandum in Support
 that they reiterated at the November 21st hearing, including some rationale for their implementation: Those highlights, which are still pertinent, include the following: 
 
· The bill comprehensively amends the emergency preparedness and planning requirements of the 2008 Fire Code by repealing provisions that required a single type of fire safety plan for all buildings and occupancies, and adding more tailored requirements for fire safety plans based on building type, use, size, complexity, risk vulnerability, presence of building staff and building occupants capable of implementing an emergency preparedness plan and voice communication capability.  The bill would also require emergency preparedness and planning for non-fire emergencies, including power outages and medical emergencies, currently required only for high-rise office buildings.  The office building-type fire safety and evacuation plan currently required for all occupancies would be retained only for the largest occupancies.  A simplified fire and emergency preparedness plan would be required for most large occupancies, and fire and emergency preparedness guide and notices would be required for apartment buildings and dormitories.  Emergency preparedness requirements would be eliminated for those occupancies, such as small, street-level storefront businesses, that are least equipped to undertake the required planning and staffing and would least benefit from such requirements. 
· The bill clarifies requirements for rooftop access and obstructions.  The requirements will enable the Fire Department to safely conduct firefighting and rescue operations and protect installers, maintenance personnel and other members of the public who have occasion to be present on a roof.  The bill also addresses rooftop access issues arising from rooftop gardens and photovoltaic solar panel rooftop installations in a manner that promotes such rooftop use consistent with the needs of firefighting operations and important public safety purposes served by rooftop access and clear paths.
 
· The bill clarifies the requirements for fire apparatus access roads in private developments consistent with the interpretations and guidelines the Fire Department has adopted to address issues that have arisen since the enactment of the 2008 Fire Code.  These include modifying fire apparatus access requirements for residences set back from the street; clarifying when an alteration to a building on a substandard width public street requires sprinkler protection of the building; and clarifying roadway design and parking requirements.
· The bill reduces the roadway width of a fire apparatus access road from 38 feet to 34 feet to parallel the roadway standards for newly-constructed public streets, but increases the diameter of dead-end turnarounds from 70 feet to 76 feet, while allowing an alternative turnaround of 90 feet which would allow for a 15-foot diameter island.
 
· To facilitate firefighting and other emergency response operations, the bill requires that entrances to apartment building dwelling units and guest rooms in hotels be identified with a room number. For multi-floor units and on unsprinklered building floors that have more than eight units, the bill requires fire emergency markings that identify the room to be displayed at the bottom of the entrance door jamb.
 
· The bill facilitates the use of portable liquid oxygen for medical purposes in residential and residential health care settings by allowing the storage, handling and use of oxygen containers in such occupancies without the need to obtain a permit or a certificate of fitness. The bill imposes a requirement that the person supplying oxygen to the premises provide fire safety information to the person using the oxygen.
 
· The bill clarifies the requirements for notification of the Fire Department and the number of fire guards required when fire protection systems are out of service.
 
· The bill adopts various measures designed to promote fire safety and fire safety compliance on construction sites, by clarifying fire guard, no smoking and oxygen and acetylene storage requirements, and requiring a separate fire safety manager for a building under construction when the building reaches a height of twenty stories or more than 250 feet, or has a lot coverage of 200,000 square feet or greater.
 
· The bill clarifies which individuals are authorized to possess a citywide standard key, which is the key required to be used to operate elevators in the fireman service mode.
 
· Consistent with requirements in neighboring jurisdictions, the bill promotes emergency responder safety by prohibiting the transportation of propane containers in the trunk of a passenger motor vehicle or other area of such vehicle not readily visible to emergency responders.
 
· The bill addresses the design, installation, operation and maintenance of battery systems to address the new technologies used to provide standby power and uninterruptable power supply in buildings.
 
· The bill promotes the use of clean burning renewable energy by allowing the use of hydrogen fuels in motor vehicles and industrial trucks (hi-lows).
 
· The bill adopts National Fire Protection Association standards for the design, installation, operation and maintenance of elevated fixed guideway transit and passenger rail systems; road tunnels, bridges and other limited access highways, and fire protection systems and other fire safety measures at wastewater treatment and collection facilities and electric generating plants.
 
· The bill adopts updated editions of sixty National Fire Protection Association (NFPA) Referenced Standards, thereby promoting compliance with the most modern nationally-accepted industry standards.
IV.     MODEL CODES
A model code is a document that a State or municipality may adopt in its entirety, or adopt with such modifications as it deems to be suitable. Model codes are often viewed as being advantageous because they offer contemporary and technical information from a reputable source and are kept current through review by the nationally recognized model code organization that issued the particular code. Most model codes are updated on a regular basis and developed through a review process that encourages sound practices and use of acceptable state-of-the-art technology. Even when a model code has not been adopted in a jurisdiction, architects and engineers often utilize model code parameters in their building designs, so long as they do not conflict with the applicable local code.

V.     INTERNATIONAL CODE COUNCIL

The ICC was established in 1994 as a non-profit organization dedicated to developing a single set of comprehensive and coordinated national model construction codes.
 Due to the evolving nature of engineering and technology, local governments rely on model codes promulgated by independent organizations, such as the ICC, to form the basis of their codes.
 Most model codes are updated on a regular basis by the code organization that issued the respective code and are usually developed through a review process that encourages sound practices and the use of acceptable state-of-the-art technology. The ICC’s mission is to provide the highest quality codes, standards, products, and services for all concerned with the safety and performance of the built environment.
 The ICC has developed an inventory of I-Codes that include the following:
· International Fire Code
· International Building Code
· International Energy Conservation Code
· International Existing Building Code
· International Fuel Gas Code
· International Green Construction Code
· International Mechanical Code
· ICC Performance Code
· International Plumbing Code
· International Private Sewage Disposal Code
· International Property Maintenance Code
· International Residential Code
· International Swimming Pool and Spa Code
· International Wildland Urban Interface Code
· International Zoning Code
The ICC offers technical, educational and informational products and services in support of the I-Codes that it produces. These services include code application assistance, educational programs and certification programs.
 The ICC was formed to produce a single set of codes so that code enforcement officials, architects, engineers, designers and contractors can work with a more consistent set of requirements throughout the United States.  The ICC’s website states “The mission of the ICC is to provide the highest quality codes, standards, products, and services for all concerned with the safety and performance of the built environment.”
  

VI.    PROPOSED INT. NO. 1174-A
Bill section 1 sets forth the legislative intent underlying enactment of the law.

Bill section 2 amends paragraphs l, m, n and o of subdivision 2 of Charter §1301, which relates to the powers of the Department of Small Business Services (“DSBS”).  In conjunction with Section 3, this provision amends and clarifies the respective roles of the Fire Department and DSBS with respect to the regulation of seaplane bases and helistops.

Bill section 3 amends subdivision g of Charter §487, which relates to the powers of the Fire Department.  In conjunction with Section 2, this provision amends and clarifies the respective roles of the Fire Department and DSBS with respect to the regulation of seaplane bases and helistops.

Bill section 4 amends Chapter 4 of the Plumbing Code to add a new Section 429 that, consistent with amended Fire Code Section FC318.5, requires a rooftop hose connection to ensure that there is a water supply for rooftop gardens or landscaping.

Bill section 5 amends Section 507.16 of the Mechanical Code to eliminate the requirement that the performance test of the ventilation system for commercial cooking appliances be witnessed by a Fire Department representative to conform it with the amendment of Fire Code Section FC904.11.4, and to require instead that the test be witnessed by a special inspector.
Bill section 6 sets forth the full text of the Fire Code (as codified in Chapter 2 of Title 29 of the Administrative Code, consisting of Chapters 1 through 45 and Appendices A and B), as amended by this local law.  Deletions are shown in [brackets]; new text is underlined.  Most of the new text represents existing Fire Code requirements that have been reorganized, relocated and/or renumbered, and editorial corrections, not substantive changes.  .

Bill section 7 provides that all actions and proceedings, civil or criminal, commenced prior to the effective date of this local law in accordance with any provision repealed or relocated by this local law and pending immediately prior to the taking effect of such repeal or relocation may be prosecuted and defended to final effect in the same manner as they might if those provisions had not been repealed or relocated.  
Bill section 8 provides that rules promulgated by the Fire Commissioner in accordance with the law in effect prior to the effective date of this local law shall remain in effect for the matters covered to the extent that such rules are not inconsistent with the Fire Code, as amended by this local law, unless and until such rules are amended or repealed by the Fire Commissioner. This section serves to ensure continuity of enforcement of existing rule requirements until such time as new rules or rule amendments are adopted.
Bill section 9 of the local law provides for the local law to take effect 90 days after enactment, and authorizes the Fire Commissioner to take, prior to such effective date, any actions necessary to the timely implementation of the local law, including the promulgation of rules.
VII.    AMENDMENTS TO INT. NO. 1174 

Section 507.16 of the New York City Mechanical Code was amended to require performance testing of commercial cooking exhaust systems be witnessed by a special inspector rather than a representative of the Fire Department.  Special inspectors are licensed professional authorized to certify the results of inspections and tests required by the New York City Building Code and Mechanical Code.

Section FC 105.4(5) is amended to renumber subdivisions 6.1 and 6.2 to 5.1 and 5.2 respectively, as such subdivisions were erroneously numbered.

Section FC 2202 is renumbered as FC 2202.1 to correct the cross-reference to the definition for alcohol-blended motor fuel.

Section FC 402.1 is added to reference the definition of covered mall added to FC Chapter 4.

Section FC 307.6 is amended by changing the term “Coked” to “Coke” to correct a typographical error.

Section FC 401.3.4 is amended to clarify the meaning of this subdivision by making separate reference to building information cards and floor plans.

Section FC 401.3.6 is amended by requiring preparation and submission of a comprehensive fire safety and emergency action (Level 1) plan within 24 months (after promulgation of rules).  Originally, the submission timeframe was 18 months. This amendment provides an additional six months for the preparation and submission of a comprehensive fire safety and emergency action (Level 1) plan.

Section FC 401.3.8 is amended by including lessees of tenant spaces and similar occupant spaces in order to clarify that employers of building occupants includes lessees of tenant spaces and that cooperation in the development and coordination of an emergency preparedness plan includes designation of building occupants to assist in the implementation of the plan.

Section FC 401.7.3 and FC 401.7.4 are amended to clarify that emergency preparedness drills are to be conducted in a manner that best assures participation of regular building occupants in the drills and educational activities, and that owners and employers of building occupants are to require participation of building occupants in such drills and education.  

Section FC 402.1 is amended by adding the definition of “Covered Mall”  and how that term is used in connection with emergency planning and preparedness provisions in FC Chapter 4, and to clarify the meaning of the term anchor store/anchor building as used in that context. 

Section FC 405.2.1 is amended to reflect that references to Group R-1 residential buildings also includes Group R-1 occupancies.

Section FC 407.2.2 is amended to delete reference to specific FLS staffing and instead authorize the fire department to determine and establish the appropriate staffing for assembly occupancies through rulemaking. Additionally, FC 407.2.2 is amended to clarify that the duties of the certificate of fitness for certain FLS staff in assembly occupancies are not limited to crowd control by adopting a more suitable title for such certificate of fitness.

Section FC 407.3.2 is amended by clarifying that the duties of the certificate of fitness for certain FEP staff in assembly occupancies are not limited to crowd control by adopting a more suitable title for such certificate of fitness.

Section FC 407.5.1 relating to Group A occupancies is amended to eliminate the requirement for a rope or tape for lawful standee areas where there is a single row of standees and the locations are marked in an approved manner (such that the rope or tape are rendered unnecessary).

Section FC 413 is amended by requiring an FEP coordinator, rather than a FLS director, in hospitals by deleting FC 413.3 and amending FC 413.4 (now renumbered FC 413.3).  Additionally, FC 413 is amended by renumbering FC 413.4 and 413.5 as well as to correct a typographical error in FC 413.5.

Section FC 414.1 is amended by eliminating the reference, “accessory thereto,” inadvertently included in the provision, which erroneously indicates that covered malls subject to the section are accessory to other Group M buildings.

Section FC 414.2.1 is amended by requiring a comprehensive fire safety/emergency action (Level 1) plan for a covered mall of more than 300,000 square feet or a building with one or more Group M occupancies with an aggregate area of that size. Furthermore, FC 414.2.1 is amended by eliminating the reference to exclusion of anchor buildings from the calculation of the area of the occupancy, an issue addressed in the newly-added definition of covered mall.

Section FC 414.2.2 is amended by deleting reference to specific FLS staffing and instead authorizes the Fire Department to determine and establish the appropriate staffing for mercantile occupancies through rulemaking.

Section FC 414.3.1 is amended by eliminating reference to exclusion of anchor buildings from the calculation of the area of the occupancy, an issue addressed in the newly-added definition of covered mall.

Section FC 414.4 is added and amended to authorize the Fire Department to establish by rule different emergency plan or staffing requirements for any Group M building or covered mall when warranted by the configuration of the building or mall.  

Section FC 501.4.3.1 is amended by retitling the subdivision by adding “public streets” to more accurately reflect the contents of the subdivision.

Section FC 501.1 and FC 501.1.1 was amended to clarify the signage requirements of the section apply to all developments including outdoor shopping malls, office parks and housing complexes and to authorize the Fire Department to require special signage where the individual buildings or tenant spaces do not have separate street addresses, so as to ensure that firefighting and other emergency response personnel can expeditiously locate such buildings or tenant spaces.

Section FC 501.4.2 is amended by specifying the location of the fire emergency marking, previously included in other subdivisions in the section but inadvertently omitted from this subdivision.

Section FC 510.2 is amended by conforming the terminology used in this section to standard Fire Code terminology.

Section FC 803.2.2 is amended to correct a typographical error by deleting a hyphen in the title to now read “Heat release rate”.

Section FC 2209 is amended by making an editorial and grammatical correction by substituting “generating” for “generation.”

Section FC 2906.8.1 is amended by correcting the formatting of the local law by deleting a strikethrough.

Section FC 4006.6 is amended by adding language “public side of the door” for clarifying the location of the signage required by the subdivision.

� Administration’s Memorandum In Support to Int. No. 1174, On file with the Committee.


� International Code Council, About ICC. available at:


http://www.iccsafe.org/AboutICC/Pages/default.aspx


� NYC Department of Buildings, 2011 Construction Codes Revision Handbook. available at: http://www.nyc.gov/html/dob/downloads/pdf/coderevisions_handbook2011.pdf


� International Code Council, About ICC. available at:


http://www.iccsafe.org/AboutICC/Pages/default.aspx


� Id.





� International Code Council’s website at � HYPERLINK "http://www.iccsafe.org/news/about/" ��http://www.iccsafe.org/news/about/�.





PAGE  
14

