Staff:
Edward Atkin, Counsel to the Committee


Cullen Howe, Legislative Attorney

Guillermo Patino, Legislative Policy Analyst

Nathan Toth, Deputy Director, Finance Division





[image: image1.png]



THE COUNCIL
REPORT OF THE INFRASTRUCTURE DIVISION

ROBERT NEWMAN, LEGISLATIVE DIRECTOR 

COMMITTEE ON HOUSING AND BUILDINGS

Hon. Erik Martin Dilan, Chair

November 14, 2013
PROPOSED INT. NO. 1092-A:
By Council Members Lappin, Chin, Comrie, James, Koo, Lander, Mendez, Richards and Rose
TITLE:
A Local Law to amend the administrative code of the city of New York and the New York city building code, in relation to secondary electrical power, heating and cooling systems for I-1 and I-2 occupancies and for adult homes, enriched housing, community residences and intermediate care facilities, where such occupancies are located in flood-prone areas.
ADMINISTRATIVE CODE:
Adds new sections 28-104.7.14, 28-104.7.15, 28-315.8.2 and 28-315.8.3.
BUILDING CODE:
Amends section G102.1 and adds new sections G304.5 and G311.
PROPOSED INT. NO. 1093-A
By Council Members Levin, Chin, Comrie, James, Lander, Mendez, Richards and Rose
TITLE:
A Local Law to amend the administrative code of the city of New York and the New York city building code, in relation to removing barriers to the usage of temporary flood control and response devices.
ADMINISTRATIVE CODE:
Amends sections 18-109 and 18-113.
BUILDING CODE:
Adds new sections 3201.9, 3202.1.1.1, G308.6 and G308.7 and amends sections 3202.4 and G501.1.
PROPOSED INT. NO. 1094-A:
By Council Members Mendez, Brewer, Chin, James, Lander, Richards, Rose, Rodriguez, Arroyo and Mark-Viverito
TITLE:
A Local Law to amend the New York city plumbing code and the administrative code of the city of New York, in relation to requiring residential buildings to provide drinking water to a common area supplied directly through pressure in the public water main.
ADMINISTRATIVE CODE:
Adds new section 28-315.8.
PLUMBING CODE:
Amends Table 403.1 and adds new section PC 614.
PROPOSED INT. NO. 1101-A:
By Council Members Vacca, Chin, James, Koo, Lander, Mendez, Recchia, Richards and Rose
TITLE:
A Local Law to amend the administrative code of the city of New York, the New York city building code and the New York city mechanical code, in relation to emergency and standby power systems and natural gas usage.
ADMINISTRATIVE CODE:
Amends sections 27-3025 and 28-109.3.
BUILDING CODE:
Amends sections 402.12, 403.10, 403.11, 404.6, 405.9, 405.10, 414.5.4, 909.11, 909.20.6.2, 1007.4, 1007.5, 1008.1.3.3, 1707.7, BC 2702, 3003.1 and 3102.8.2.
MECHANICAL CODE:
Amends section 513.11.
Introduction and Procedural History


On November 14, 2013, the Committee on Housing and Buildings, chaired by Council Member Erik Martin Dilan, will conduct a hearing on Proposed Int. 1092-A, Proposed Int. 1093-A, Proposed Int. 1094-A, and Proposed Int. 1101-A.


On June 27, 2013, the Committee in conjunction with a number of other Committees, held a hearing on these bills and received testimony from the New York City Office of Long Term Planning and Sustainability; the Urban Green Council; the International Code Council; Gilsanz, Murray, Steficek; the American Institute of Architects; Riverkeeper; the National Resources Defense Council; and the Plumbing Foundation. The Committee also received feedback from additional stakeholders after the hearing. In light of the received feedback and testimony, the bills have been amended as described below.

Hurricane Sandy and the Building Resiliency Task Force

On October 29, 2012, Hurricane Sandy struck New York City causing record storm surges and flooding throughout Lower Manhattan, Brooklyn, Staten Island, Coney Island, and the Rockaways.
 Forty-three New Yorkers lost their lives; many more were injured; and tens of thousands were temporarily or permanently displaced.
 In addition, Sandy caused roughly $19 billion in “infrastructure and property damage and economic loss” to the city.


In November 2012, Mayor Bloomberg and New York City Council Speaker Christine Quinn announced the formation of the Building Resiliency Task Force (“BRTF”).
 BRTF is a collection of “more than 200 dedicated volunteers who are leading experts in their fields” including “real estate owners, property managers, architects, engineers, contractors, utility representatives, subject matter specialists, city officials, code consultants, cost estimators and attorneys.”
 In June 2013, BRTF issued a report with 33 proposals for improving building resiliency in the city for both new and existing buildings.
 Those BRTF proposals formed the basis for the bills now under consideration.
Proposed Int. No. 1092-A


Proposed Int. No. 1092-A requires that healthcare facilities in flood-prone areas, including residential healthcare facilities, have backup electrical power systems and that hospitals in flood-prone areas additionally have backup heating and cooling systems when necessary.


Bill section one would require that the title sheet of construction documents submitted to the Department of Buildings (“DOB”) must list whether healthcare facilities in flood-prone areas are exempt from temporary external generator connection and temporary boiler and chiller requirements, as discussed below.


Bill section two would require that existing buildings whose main use is as a healthcare facility, such as a hospital, nursing home or a residential care facility, and which are located in a flood-prone area, must retroactively comply with the temporary external generator connection requirements discussed below by January 1, 2033. A report of compliance must be filed with DOB by such date as well. This section further provides that, where such buildings are newly mapped into a flood-prone area after the date of this local law, the period of compliance will be 20 years from the date the building was mapped into the flood-prone area.


Bill section three would require that existing buildings whose main use is as a hospital, and which are located in a flood-prone area, must comply with the temporary boiler and chiller requirements discussed below, and file a report of compliance, by January 1, 2033 or the applicable time frame for buildings newly mapped into flood-prone areas.


Bill section four would require (1) that new or substantially improved healthcare facilities either (a) have electrical connections allowing for the hook up of temporary external generators capable of providing secondary power to specified electrical systems and services for at least 72 hours or (b) have permanently installed secondary power systems located above expected flood levels and capable of providing power to specified electrical systems and services for at least 72 hours; (2) that new or substantially improved hospitals either (a) have connections allowing for the hook up of temporary boilers and chillers capable of providing adequate heating and cooling for patient care and sleeping areas for at least 72 hours or (b) have permanently installed boilers and chillers located above expected flood levels and capable of providing adequate heating and cooling to such areas for at least 72 hours; and (3) that all buildings required to comply with the temporary external generator and/or boiler and chiller connection requirements submit an “emergency connection plan” to DOB detailing how the temporary equipment will be connected and operational within 72 hours of failure of the primary equipment.


Bill section five reiterates the retroactive requirements for existing healthcare facilities. This section also provides that compliance reports related to temporary external generator connections must be completed by a registered design professional or licensed master electrician, and the reports related to temporary boiler and chiller plants must be completed by a registered design professional.

Bill section six contains the enactment clause and provides that this local law would take effect on the same date that Int. No. 1056, a local law relating to bringing the city’s Construction Codes up to date with international codes, takes effect.
Amendments to Int. No. 1092


The bill has been substantively amended as follows:

· The application of the temporary external generator connection requirement has been amended to apply only to healthcare facilities located within flood-prone areas rather than citywide. Further, healthcare facilities are exempt from this requirement if they have permanently installed emergency or standby power systems that are located above expected flood levels and capable of meeting the power requirements identified for the temporary external generators.

· The temporary external generator requirement for occupancy group I-1 and residential healthcare facilities has been amended so that such generators when necessary power emergency lighting, fire alarm systems and, in certain taller buildings, an elevator, rather than all electrical services.

· The temporary boiler and chiller connection requirement for hospitals is new.

· The retroactive requirements referred to in the original bill have been clarified.

· The enactment clause has been modified so that this local law will take effect when Int. No. 1056 takes effect, rather than immediately.

Proposed Int. No. 1093-A


Proposed Int. No. 1093-A would allow for the use of temporary flood shields and barriers and temporary stairs and ramps in flood-prone areas.


Bill section one and two would amend the Administrative Code to allow the installation of temporary flood shields, stairs or ramps or continuous footings for temporary flood shields in accordance with the Building Code on boardwalks, beaches and on Ocean Parkway.


Bill section three would provide that any encroachment into the public right-of-way in excess of the limits specified in the Building Code shall require the approval of the Department of Transportation.


Bill section four would allow, in flood-prone areas, the installation of “continuous footings for the support and attachment of temporary, removable dry floodproofing barriers or shields” extending beyond the street line up to 12 inches both at grade and below grade.


Bill section five would allow, in flood-prone areas, “permanent attachments to building facades necessary for the support and attachment of” temporary flood barriers or shields to project beyond the street line up to 6 inches.


Bill section six would require that, in flood-prone areas, temporary flood shields, stairs and ramps must (1) comply with Sections G308.6 and G308.7 of Appendix G of the Building Code; (2) project no more than 1 foot beyond the street line and (3) be removed in a timely manner after a flood event.


Bill section seven would allow for the use of temporary flood shields, stairs and ramps in flood-prone areas. Temporary flood shields must comply with section 6.2.3 of ASCE 24. For new buildings that are planned to be evacuated during flooding, temporary stairs and ramps may be used for egress, but only from portions of the building other than dwelling units, patient care areas and areas intended for sleeping. For existing buildings, temporary stairs and ramps can generally be used for egress but can only be used for egress from dwelling units, patient care areas and areas intended for sleeping if the stairs or ramps comply with requirements for normal egress stairs and ramps.


Bill section eight would require that required emergency plans for temporary flood shields also address (1) the usage of temporary stairs and ramps, if such devices are planned to be used and (2) the timely removal of shields, stairs and ramps.


Bill section nine contains the enactment clause and provides that this local law would take effect immediately upon enactment.
Amendments to Int. No. 1093


The bill has been substantively amended in the following manner:

· The substance of bill section seven is new. The original bill would have generally permitted temporary stairs and ramps but would have required that they comply with the requirements for normal egress stairs and ramps regardless of the area served or whether the building was new or existing.

· Section eight of the original bill, which would have permitted nonresidential buildings entirely evacuated during an emergency to maintain only one elevated means of egress, has been removed.

· Required emergency plans are now also required to specify when and how temporary flood shields, stairs and ramps will be removed. In the original bill, only their installation was addressed.

Proposed Int. No. 1094-A
Proposed Int. No. 1094-A would require certain residential buildings to provide fixtures which can supply drinking water to a common area in the event that the water pump that serves such building fails. A building must provide one fixture for every 100 occupants of the building as determined by the occupant load of the building.  Buildings that have water pumps that are connected to an emergency or standby power system that complies with the Building Code would be exempt from these requirements. Existing residential buildings greater than five stories will have 8 years to make these fixtures available.  

Bill section one adds a new footnote (m) to table 403.1 of the Plumbing Code to note that, in accordance with the table, I-1, R-1, R-2 and R-3 occupancies must provide fixtures in line with the requirements of section PC 614 for emergency drinking water access.


Bill section two adds a new Section 614 to the Plumbing Code.  This section will require I-1, R-1, R-2 and R-3 occupancies served by water pumps to provide fixtures which can supply drinking water to a common area in the building in the event that the water pump serving such building fails. The fixtures must comply with sections 614.1.1 through 614.1.5. Section 614.1.1 specifies the types of fixtures that will be required; section 614.1.5 identifies the number of fixtures needed based on the building’s occupant load; section 614.1.3 specifies where such fixtures may be located; section 614.1.4 specifies the signage needed to readily identify such fixtures and section 614.1.5 addresses when certain existing buildings have to make such fixtures available. Buildings that have pumps that are connected to an emergency or standby power system that complies with the Building Code are exempt from the bill’s requirements.  


Bill section three adds a new section 28-315.8 to the Administrative Code to provide that, within 8 years, existing buildings greater than five stories in height must provide fixtures for building occupants in compliance with section 614 of the Plumbing Code.


Bill section four states that this local law will go into effect on the same date that Intro. 1056 goes into effect.
Amendments to Int. No. 1094
The bill was substantively amended as follows:

· The bill now allows for the use of faucets or fixtures capable of being attached to a splitter and either a sink or floor drain.

· The bill requires one fixture for every 100 occupants of the building as determined by the occupant load of the building instead of one for every 75 occupants.

· The provision specifying that, in areas of special flood hazard, fixtures must be located on a story that is entirely above the design flood elevation was removed.
· Language was added to make clear that areas where fixtures are located must be accessible to building occupants.  

· The bill was amended to provide that existing buildings greater than five stories must comply with the fixture requirements within 8 years of enactment.  The bill previously required all existing buildings to comply with its requirements by January 1, 2019.
Proposed Int. No. 1101-A


Proposed Int. No. 1101-A would introduce a classification scheme and requirements for secondary power sources, allow natural gas to be used as a fuel supply for certain secondary power systems and provide minimum load requirements for voluntarily installed (optional) secondary power systems.


Bill section one would adopt the three-tiered classification scheme for secondary power systems utilized in the National Electrical Code and International Building Code and includes certain New York City-specific modifications. Secondary power systems would be classified as emergency power systems, legally required standby power systems or optional standby systems, and the electrical services or systems to be served by such power sources are specified. This section would also allow for fuel cell systems to serve as a source of power for emergency power systems in R-2 occupancies and  standby power systems in all occupancies.


Bill sections two through ten and twelve through fourteen would identify the electrical services that must be backed up by either emergency or standby power. Examples of such systems include emergency voice/alarm communication systems, fire alarm systems, smoke control systems, elevators, horizontal sliding doors, auxiliary inflation systems for membrane structures and voice/alarm communication systems in covered mall buildings.


Bill section eleven would allow natural gas from the public utility to be used as the sole fuel source for (1) emergency power systems serving R-2 occupancies and (2) standby power systems generally. Where such a fuel source is to be used, a separate outside gas cut-off valve must be installed in accordance with the Fuel Gas Code. This section would also require that voluntarily installed (optional) standby systems must be capable of providing power for emergency lighting, fire alarm systems and, in certain taller buildings, an elevator, in additional to any other loads.


Bill section fifteen contains the enactment clause and provides that this local law would take effect immediately upon enactment.
Amendments to Int. No. 1101

The bill has been substantively amended in the following manner:

· Bill section one is new. The original bill did not address the classification of secondary power systems.

· For emergency power systems, natural gas from the public utility main may only be used as a fuel source in R-2 occupancies rather than in all occupancies.

Update
On Thursday, November 14, 2013, the Committee adopted this legislation.  Accordingly, the Committee recommends its adoption.
THIS PAGE INTENTIONALLY LEFT BLANK.

Proposed Int. No. 1092-A

 

By Council Members Lappin, Chin, Comrie, James, Koo, Lander, Mendez, Richards and Rose
 

A LOCAL LAW

To amend the administrative code of the city of New York and the New York city building code, in relation to secondary electrical power, heating and cooling systems for I-1 and I-2 occupancies and for adult homes, enriched housing, community residences and intermediate care facilities, where such occupancies are located in flood-prone areas. 
 

Be it enacted by the Council as follows:
 

Section 1. Article 104 of chapter 1 of title 28 of the administrative code of the city of New York is amended by adding new sections 28-104.7.14 and 28-104.7.15 to read as follows:

§ 28-104.7.14 Identification of certain I-1 and I-2 occupancies and of certain adult homes, enriched housing, community residences and intermediate care facilities as exempt from temporary external generator connection requirements. The title sheet of construction documents for the following buildings shall list whether the building is exempt from the requirement to provide connections for temporary external generators pursuant to any exception contained in sections G304.5.1 or G304.5.2 of appendix G of the New York city building code, as applicable:

1. A new or substantially improved building, as such term is defined in appendix G of the New York city building code, that contains space classified in occupancy group I-1 or I-2 or space that is an adult home, enriched housing, community residence or intermediate care facility classified as occupancy group R pursuant to an exception to section 308.2.1 or 308.2.2 of the New York city building code, and that is located in an area of special flood hazard, as such term is defined in appendix G of the New York city building code; and

2. A new or substantially improved building that contains space classified as an occupancy group I-2 hospital and that is located in a shaded X-Zone, as such terms are defined in appendix G of the New York city building code.  

§ 28-104.7.15 Identification of certain hospitals as exempt from temporary external boiler or chiller connection requirements. The title sheet of construction documents for a new or substantially improved building, as such term is defined in appendix G of the New York city building code, that contains space classified as an occupancy group I-2 hospital and that is located in an area of special flood hazard or shaded X-Zone, as such terms are defined in appendix G of the New York city building code, shall list whether the requirement to provide connections for temporary external boilers and chillers pursuant to Item 2 of section G304.5.2 is inapplicable as a result of such building having its boiler and chiller plants located at or above the applicable design flood elevation.

§2. Chapter 3 of title 28 of the administrative code of the city of New York, as amended by a local law of the city of New York for the year 2013 amending the administrative code of the city of New York, the New York city plumbing code, the New York city building code, the New York city mechanical code and the New York city fuel gas code, relating to bringing such codes up to date with the 2009 editions of the international building, mechanical, fuel gas and plumbing codes, as proposed in introduction number 1056, is amended by adding new sections 28-315.8.2 and 28-315.8.3 to read as follows:
§28-315.8.2 Connections for temporary external generators. For the following buildings, the provision of connections for temporary external generators in accordance with the retroactive requirements of section G311.2 of appendix G of the New York city building code shall be completed by January 1, 2033, and a report detailing compliance with such requirements shall be filed with the department in accordance with section G311.2.2 by such date: 
1. Buildings whose main use or dominant occupancy is group I-1 and that are located in an area of special flood hazard, as such term is defined in appendix G of the New York city building code;
2. Buildings whose main use or dominant occupancy is an adult home, enriched housing, community residence or intermediate care facility classified as occupancy group R pursuant to an exception to section 308.2.1 or 308.2.2 of the New York city building code and that are located in an area of special flood hazard, as such term is defined in appendix G of the New York city building code;

3. Buildings whose main use or dominant occupancy is group I-2 hospital and that are located in an area of special flood hazard or shaded X-Zone, as such terms are defined in appendix G of the New York city building code;

4. Buildings whose main use or dominant occupancy is group I-2 nursing home and that are located in an area of special flood hazard, as such term is defined in appendix G of the New York city building code; and

5. Buildings whose main use or dominant occupancy is group I-2, other than hospitals and nursing homes, and that are located in an area of special flood hazard, as such term is defined in appendix G of the New York city building code.

§ 28-315.8.2.1 Modification to the area of special flood hazard or shaded X-Zone. Where the area of special flood hazard or shaded X-Zone, as established in appendix G of the New York city building code, is modified on or after the effective date of this section, any building identified in section 28-315.8.2 and newly identified as being within such modified area of special flood hazard or shaded X-Zone shall, no later than 20 years following the adoption of such modification, comply with the retroactive requirements of section G311.2 of appendix G of the New York city building code. The owner of such building shall, no later than 20 years following the adoption of such modification, file with the department a report detailing compliance with such requirements in accordance with section G311.2.2.
§ 28-315.8.3 Connections for temporary external boilers and chillers. For buildings whose main use or dominant occupancy is group I-2 hospital and that are located in an area of special flood hazard or shaded X-Zone, as such terms are defined in appendix G of the New York city building code, the provision of connections for temporary external boilers and chillers in accordance with the retroactive requirements of section G311.3 of appendix G of the New York city building code shall be completed by January 1, 2033, and a report detailing compliance with such requirements shall be filed with the department in accordance with section G311.3.2 by such date. 
§ 28-315.8.3.1 Modification to the area of special flood hazard or shaded X-Zone. Where the area of special flood hazard or shaded X-Zone, as established in appendix G of the New York city building code, is modified on or after the effective date of this section, any building whose main use or dominant occupancy is group I-2 hospital and that is newly identified as being within such modified area of special flood hazard or shaded X-Zone shall, no later than 20 years following the adoption of such modification, comply with the retroactive requirements of section G311.3 of appendix G of the New York city building code. The owner of such building shall, no later than 20 years following the adoption of such modification, file with the department a report detailing compliance with such requirements in accordance with section G311.3.2.

§3. Section G102.1 of appendix G of the New York city building code, as amended by a local law of the city of New York for the year 2013 amending the administrative code of the city of New York, the New York city plumbing code, the New York city building code, the New York city mechanical code and the New York city fuel gas code, relating to bringing such codes up to date with the 2009 editions of the international building, mechanical, fuel gas and plumbing codes, as proposed in introduction number 1056, is amended by adding a new item 11  to read as follows:  

11. Retroactive requirements. This appendix shall apply to retroactive requirements as provided for in Section G311.
§4. Appendix G of the New York city building code is amended by adding a new section G304.5 to read as follows:
G304.5 Additional construction standards with respect to connections for temporary external generators, boilers and chillers. In addition to the other requirements of this chapter, connections for temporary external generators, boilers and chillers shall be provided in accordance with Sections G304.5.1 through G304.5.4. 

G304.5.1 Group I-1 and adult homes, enriched housing, community residences and intermediate care facilities. An occupancy that is classified as Group I-1, or that is an adult home, enriched housing, community residence or intermediate care facility and classified as Group R pursuant to an exception to Section 308.2.1 or 308.2.2, shall comply with the following requirements:

1. Connections for temporary external generators. Electrical connections shall be provided allowing for the connection of temporary external generators capable of providing power for at least 72 hours for, at a minimum, the following systems:

1.1. Exit signs and means of egress illumination required by Chapter 10 and serving such occupancy;

1.2. Fire alarm systems serving such occupancy;

1.3. For buildings having occupied floors located more than 75 feet (22 860 mm) above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access, at least one elevator that serves all floors; and

1.4. Lighting in such occupancy, sufficient to maintain illumination in accordance with Section 1205.3, for (i) spaces primarily used for the provision of medical services to persons, including, but not limited to, consultation, evaluation, monitoring and treatment services and (ii) spaces intended to be used by persons for sleeping purposes.

Exception: Connections for temporary external generators shall not be required for buildings with emergency or standby power systems that are permanently installed above the design flood elevation specified in Table 7-1 of ASCE 24 and capable of providing power for at least 72 hours to the systems identified in Item 1 of Section G304.5.1. Natural gas shall be a permitted fuel supply.
2. Flood protection for temporary external generator connections. Electrical connections installed in accordance with Item 1 of Section G304.5.1 shall be located at or above the design flood elevation specified in Table 7-1 of ASCE 24.

3. Emergency connection plan. Prior to sign-off of work by the department, a plan shall be submitted to the department that identifies how the temporary external generators will be connected and capable of providing power for the occupancy in accordance with Item 1 of Section G304.5.1 within 72 hours after failure of the normal power supply.

G304.5.2 Group I-2 hospitals.  An occupancy that is a Group I-2 hospital shall comply with the following requirements:

1. Connections for temporary external generators. Electrical connections shall be provided allowing for the connection of temporary external generators capable of providing power for at least 72 hours for, at a minimum, the following systems:

1.1. All electrical services serving such occupancy for which emergency or standby power must be provided in accordance with any other applicable local, state or federal law or rule; and

1.2. Air conditioning and cooling systems serving such occupancy, sufficient to maintain temperature and humidity in accordance with Section 1204, for (i) spaces primarily used for the provision of medical services to persons, including, but not limited to, consultation, evaluation, monitoring and treatment services and (ii) spaces intended to be used by persons for sleeping purposes.

Exception: Connections for temporary external generators shall not be required for buildings that have emergency or standby power systems that are permanently installed above the design flood elevation specified in Table 7-1 of ASCE 24 and capable of providing power for at least 72 hours to the systems identified in Item 1 of Section G304.5.2. Natural gas shall be a permitted fuel supply.
2. Connections for temporary external boilers and chillers.  Where boiler and chiller plants are located below the design flood elevation specified in Table 7-1 of ASCE 24 and serve (i) spaces primarily used for the provision of medical services to persons, including, but not limited to, consultation, evaluation, monitoring and treatment services or (ii) spaces intended to be used by persons for sleeping purposes, connections shall be provided to allow for the connection of temporary external boilers and chillers capable of maintaining temperature and humidity for such spaces in accordance with Section 1204 for at least 72 hours.
3. Flood protection for temporary external generator, boiler and chiller connections. Electrical connections installed in accordance with Item 1 of Section G304.5.2 and connections installed in accordance with Item 2 of Section G304.5.2 shall be located at or above the design flood elevation specified in Table 7-1 of ASCE 24.

4. Emergency connection plan. Prior to sign-off of work by the department, the following shall be submitted to the department:

4.1. For an occupancy required to comply with Item 1 of Section G304.5.2, a plan that identifies how the temporary external generators will be connected and capable of providing power for the occupancy in accordance with such item within 72 hours after failure of the normal power supply; and

4.2. For an occupancy required to comply with Item 2 of Section G304.5.2, a plan that identifies how the temporary external boilers and chillers will be connected and capable of maintaining temperature and humidity for specified spaces in accordance with Section 1204 within 72 hours after failure of the primary boiler and chiller plants.

G304.5.3 Group I-2 nursing homes. An occupancy that is a Group I-2 nursing home shall comply with Section G304.5.2.

Exception: Such occupancy is not required to comply with Items 1.2, 2 and 4.2 of Section G304.5.2.
G304.5.4  Group I-2 occupancies, other than hospitals and nursing homes. A Group I-2 occupancy, other than a hospital or a nursing home, shall comply with Section G304.5.1.

§5. Chapter G3 of appendix G of the New York city building code, as amended by a local law of the city of New York for the year 2013 amending the administrative code of the city of New York, the New York city plumbing code, the New York city building code, the New York city mechanical code and the New York city fuel gas code, relating to bringing such codes up to date with the 2009 editions of the international building, mechanical, fuel gas and plumbing codes, as proposed in introduction number 1056, is amended by adding a new section BC G311 to read as follows:  

SECTION BC G311

RETROACTIVE REQUIREMENTS

G311.1 General. Notwithstanding any other provision of the New York City Construction Codes, the provisions of this section shall apply retroactively to all buildings and structures specified herein.

G311.2  Connections for temporary external generators. The following buildings shall be provided with connections for temporary external generators in accordance with Sections G304.5.1 through G304.5.4, as applicable, by January 1, 2033, and a report detailing compliance with such requirements shall be filed with the department in accordance with Section G311.2.2 by such date:

1. Buildings whose main use or dominant occupancy is Group I-1 and that are located in an area of special flood hazard;

2. Buildings whose main use or dominant occupancy is an adult home, enriched housing, community residence or intermediate care facility that is classified as occupancy Group R pursuant to an exception to Section 308.2.1 or 308.2.2 and that are located in an area of special flood hazard;

3. Buildings whose main use or dominant occupancy is Group I-2 hospital and that are located in an area of special flood hazard or shaded X-Zone;
4. Buildings whose main use or dominant occupancy is Group I-2 nursing home and that are located in an area of special flood hazard; and

5. Buildings whose main use or dominant occupancy is Group I-2, other than hospitals and nursing homes, and that are located in an area of special flood hazard.

G311.2.1 Modification to the area of special flood hazard or shaded X-Zone. Where the area of special flood hazard or shaded X-Zone is modified on or after the effective date of this section, any building identified in section G311.2 and newly identified as being within such modified area of special flood hazard or shaded X-Zone shall, no later than 20 years following the adoption of such modification, comply with the retroactive requirements of Section G311.2. The owner of such building shall, no later than 20 years following the adoption of such modification, file with the department a report detailing compliance with such requirements in accordance with section G311.2.2. 

G311.2.2 Report of compliance. The owner of a building required to comply with the provisions of Section G311.2 shall file with the department, by January 1, 2033, a report prepared by a registered design professional or licensed master electrician (i) certifying that the requirements of Section G311.2 have been satisfied and detailing how such requirements were satisfied or (ii) certifying that the building met or was altered to meet the provisions of any applicable exception in Sections G304.5.1 or G304.5.2. 
G311.2.3 Filing. The department may promulgate rules establishing filing fees for the review and examination of such reports.
G311.3 Connections for temporary external boilers and chillers. Buildings whose main use or dominant occupancy is Group I-2 hospital and that are located in an area of special flood hazard or shaded X-Zone shall be provided with connections for temporary external boilers and chillers in accordance with Section G304.5.2 by January 1, 2033, and a report detailing compliance with such requirements shall be filed with the department in accordance with Section G311.3.2 by such date.
G311.3.1 Modification to the area of special flood hazard or shaded X-Zone. Where the area of special flood hazard or shaded X-Zone is modified on or after the effective date of this section, any building whose main use or dominant occupancy is Group I-2 hospital and that is newly identified as being within such modified area of special flood hazard or shaded X-Zone shall comply with the retroactive requirements of Section G311.3 no later than 20 years following the adoption of such modification. The owner of such building shall file with the department a report detailing compliance with such requirements in accordance with section G311.3.2 no later than 20 years following the adoption of such modification.

G 311.3.2 Report of compliance. The owner of a building required to comply with the provisions of Section G311.3 shall file with the department, by January 1, 2033, a report prepared by a registered design professional (i) certifying that the requirements of Section G311.3 have been satisfied and detailing how such requirements were satisfied or (ii) certifying that any boiler and chiller plants that serve the spaces specified in Item 2 of Section G304.5.2 are located at or above the design flood elevation specified in Table 7-1 of ASCE 24. 
G311.3.3 Filing. The department may promulgate rules establishing filing fees for the review and examination of such reports.

§6. This local law shall take effect on the same date that a local law of the city of New York for the year 2013 amending the administrative code of the city of New York, the New York City plumbing code, the New York city building code, the New York city mechanical code and the New York city fuel gas code, relating to bringing such codes up to date with the 2009 editions of the international building, mechanical, fuel gas and plumbing codes, as proposed in introduction number 1056, takes effect.
11/6/2013 11:08PM
Proposed Int. No. 1093-A

By Council Members Levin, Chin, Comrie, James, Lander, Mendez, Richards and Rose

A LOCAL LAW

To amend the administrative code of the city of New York and the New York city building code, in relation to removing barriers to the usage of temporary flood control and response devices.

Be it enacted by the Council as follows:


Section 1. Section 18-109 of the administrative code of the city of New York is amended by adding a new subdivision c to read as follows

c. This section shall not prevent or make unlawful the installation of footings for temporary barriers or shields in accordance with section 3202.1.1.1 of the New York city building code or temporary flood shields, stairs or ramps in accordance with section 3202.4.3 of the New York city building code.

§2. Section 18-113 of the administrative code of the city of New York is amended by adding a new subdivision c to read as follows:

c. This section shall not prevent or make unlawful the installation of footings for temporary barriers or shields in accordance with section 3202.1.1.1 of the New York city building code or temporary flood shields, stairs or ramps in accordance with section 3202.4.3 of the New York city building code.
§3. Chapter 32 of the New York city building code is amended by adding new section 3201.9 to read as follows:

3201.9 Department of Transportation approval. Any encroachment into the public right-of-way that exceeds the limitation provided for in this chapter shall require the approval of the Department of Transportation.

§4. Section BC 3202 of the New York city building code is amended by adding a new section 3202.1.1.1 to read as follows:

3202.1.1.1  Footings for temporary barriers or shields in areas of special flood hazard or shaded X-Zones. In areas of special flood hazard or shaded X-Zones, continuous footings for the support and attachment of temporary, removable dry floodproofing barriers or shields may be constructed to project beyond the street line not more than 12 inches (305 mm) both at grade and below grade.  

§5. Section BC 3202 of the New York city building code is amended by adding new section 3202.2.2.3 to read as follows:

3202.2.2.3 Flood shield supports. In areas of special flood hazard or shaded X-Zones, permanent attachments to building facades necessary for the support and attachment of temporary, removable dry floodproofing barriers or shields may be constructed to project beyond the street line for a distance of not more than 6 inches (152 mm).
§6. Section 3202.4 of the New York city building code, as added by local law number 33 for the year 2007, is amended to read as follows:

3202.4 Temporary encroachments. Encroachments of temporary nature shall comply with Sections 3202.4.1 [and 3202.4.2] through 3202.4.3.

3202.4.1 Sidewalk cafés. Enclosures for sidewalk cafés, where permitted by the Commissioner of the Department of Consumer Affairs pursuant to applicable law and constructed in compliance with Section 3110, may be constructed beyond the street line.

3202.4.2 Storm enclosures. Storm enclosures projecting not more than 18 inches (457 mm) beyond the street line may be permitted during the period between November 15 and the following April 15. Such enclosures shall be removed at the end of this period. Construction of storm enclosures must comply with the requirements of this code including the fire resistance rating of the building to which it is appurtenant and Chapter 11 of this code.

3202.4.3 Temporary flood shields, stairs and ramps in areas of special flood hazard and shaded X-Zones. In areas of special flood hazard and shaded X-Zones, temporary flood shields, stairs and ramps shall comply with Sections G308.6 and G308.7 of Appendix G of the New York City Building Code and shall be permitted in accordance with plans approved by the department subject to the following conditions:

1. Such flood shields, stairs and ramps shall project no more than one foot (305 mm) beyond the street line;

2. Such flood shields, stairs and ramps shall be removed in a timely manner after a flood event.

§7. Appendix G of the New York city building code is amended by adding new sections G308.6 and G308.7 to read as follows:

G308.6 Temporary flood shields. Temporary flood shields shall be permitted in accordance with Section 6.2.3 of ASCE 24. 

G308.7 Temporary stairs and ramps. Temporary stairs and ramps shall comply with the requirements of Sections G308.7.1 and G308.7.2.

G308.7.1 Evacuated buildings. Temporary stairs and ramps shall be permitted to provide elevated ingress and egress in compliance with Item 3 of Section 6.2.2 of ASCE 24 for buildings or portions of buildings that are planned to be evacuated during design flood conditions, except for maintenance and emergency personnel, provided that such temporary stairs and ramps shall not be permitted to serve as a required means of egress for a dwelling unit or for any area described in Item 2.2.1 of Section G304.1.2 required to be located at or above the design flood elevation. 

G308.7.2 Existing buildings. Temporary stairs and ramps for an existing building or portions thereof shall be permitted to provide elevated ingress and egress in compliance with Item 3 of Section 6.2.2 of ASCE 24, including as a required means of egress for dwelling units or for areas described in Item 2.2.1 of Section G304.1.2 required to be located at or above the design flood elevation, where such temporary stairs and ramps comply with Sections 1009 and 1010.

§8. Section G501.1 of the New York city building code, as added by local law number 33 for the year 2007, is amended by adding a modification to subsection 6.2.3 of ASCE 24 to read as follows:

Section 6.2.3. Section 6.2.3 (Limits on Human Intervention) is amended to read as follows: 

Section 6.2.3 Limits on Human Intervention. Dry floodproofing measures that require human intervention to activate or implement prior to or during a flood, including temporary stairs or ramps, shall be permitted only when all of the following conditions are satisfied:

1. The flood warning time (alerting potential flood victims of pending flood situation) shall be a minimum of 12 hours, unless the community operates a flood warning system and implements an emergency plan to ensure safe evacuation of flood hazard areas, in which case human intervention is allowed only if the community can provide a minimum flood warning time equal to or longer than the cumulative:

(a) time to notify person(s) responsible for installation of floodproofing measures, plus

(b) time for responsible persons to travel to structure to be floodproofed, plus

(c) time to install, activate, or implement floodproofing measures, plus

(d) time to evacuate all occupants from the flood hazard area;

2. All removable shields or covers for openings such as windows, doors, and other openings in walls and temporary stairs or ramps shall be designed to resist flood loads specified in Section 1.6; and

3. Where removable shields or temporary stairs or ramps are to be used, a flood emergency plan shall be approved by the authority having jurisdiction and shall specify, at a minimum, the following information: storage location(s) of the shields and temporary stairs and ramps; the method of installation and removal; conditions activating installation and removal; maintenance of shields and attachment devices and temporary stairs and ramps; periodic practice of installing and removing shields and temporary stairs and ramps; testing sump pumps and other drainage measures; and inspecting necessary material and equipment to activate or implement floodproofing. The flood emergency plan shall be permanently posted in at least two conspicuous locations within the structure.

§9. This local law shall take effect immediately.

11/13/13 6:48PM
Proposed Int. No. 1094-A

By Council Members Mendez, Brewer, Chin, James, Lander, Richards, Rose, Rodriguez, Arroyo, and Mark-Viverito 
A LOCAL LAW

To amend the New York city plumbing code and the administrative code of the city of New York, in relation to requiring residential buildings to provide drinking water to a common area supplied directly through pressure in the public water main.

Be it enacted by the Council as follows:

Section 1. Occupancy I-1 in item No.5 and Occupancy R-1, R-2 and R-3 in item No.7 of table 403.1 of the New York city plumbing code, as added by local law number 41 for the year 2012, are amended and a new footnote m is added to such table to read as follows:

TABLE 403.1
MINIMUM NUMBER OF REQUIRED PLUMBING FIXTURESa
(See Sections 403.2 and 403.3)
	NO.
	CLASSIFICATION
	OCCUPANCYi
	DESCRIPTION
	WATER CLOSETS URINALS (SEE SECTION 419.2)
	LAVATORIES
	BATHTUBS/
SHOWERS
	DRINKING
FOUNTAIN (SEE
SECTION 410.1) e,f
	OTHER

	
	
	
	
	MALE
FEMALE
	MALE
FEMALE
	
	
	

	5
	Institutional
	I-1m
	Residential care
	1 per 10
	1 per 10
	1 per 8
	1 per 100
	1 service
sink


	7
	Residential
	R-1m
	Hotels, motels, boarding houses (transient)
	1 per guestroom
	1 per guestroom
	1 per
guestroom
	—
	1 service sink

	
	
	R-1m
	Dormitories,

fraternities, sororities

and boarding houses

(not transient)
	1 per 10
	1 per 10
	1 per 8
	1 per 100
	1 service sink

	
	
	R-2m
	Apartment house
	1 per dwelling unit
	1 per dwelling unit
	1 per
dwelling
unit
	—
	1 kitchen sink per dwelling unit; 1 automatic clothes washer connection per 20 dwelling unitse

	
	
	R-3
	One- and two-family

dwellings
	1 per dwelling unit
	1 per dwelling unit
	1 per
dwelling
unit
	—
	1 kitchen sink per dwelling unit; 1 automatic clothes washer connection per dwelling unite

	
	
	R-3m
	Congregate living facilities with 16 or fewer persons
	1 per 10
	1 per 10
	1 per 8
	1 per 100
	1 service
sink


m. In addition to the requirements of Table 403.1, residential occupancies I-1, R-1, R-2, and R-3 shall provide fixtures in compliance with the requirements of Section PC 614 for emergency drinking water access.
§ 2.  Chapter 6 of the New York city plumbing code is amended by adding a new section PC 614 to read as follows:

SECTION PC 614

EMERGENCY DRINKING WATER ACCESS

614.1 Buildings required to provide alternative potable water access. Buildings that supply potable water from the public water main for dwelling units and sleeping units in occupancy groups I-1, R-1, R-2, and R-3 with the assistance of pumps shall provide additional fixtures that in an emergency when such pumps are inoperable are capable of supplying potable water from the public water main to the building utilizing only the available pressure from the public water main.  Such fixtures shall comply with Sections 614.1.1 through 614.1.5. 
Exception: Buildings where the pumps used to supply potable water for the dwelling units or sleeping units are connected to an emergency or a standby power system that complies with the requirements of Chapter 27 of the New York City Building Code.
614.1.1 Emergency water fixture. Fixtures capable of supplying an emergency source of potable water in accordance with this section shall consist of a faucet conforming to Section PC 424 or a fixture conforming to Section PC 424 that is capable of attaching to a splitter and either:

1. a sink conforming to Section PC 418; or

2. a floor drain conforming to Section PC 412.
614.1.2 Number of emergency water fixtures required. One such fixture shall be provided for each 100 occupants as determined by the occupant load of the building.

614.1.3 Access to emergency water fixtures. Fixtures capable of supplying an emergency source of potable water in accordance with this section shall be located indoors in one or more common areas of the building. Such area shall be on an accessible route that complies with Section 1104.3 of the New York City Building Code.  Where such area requires users to pass through a doorway to access the emergency water fixture, such area shall further comply with Section 1107.3 of the New York City Building Code.  Emergency fixtures shall comply with Section 1109.12 of the New York City Building Code.
Exception. Such fixtures shall not be located in a bathroom or toilet room.
614.1.4 Signage. Fixtures capable of supplying an emergency source of potable water in accordance with this section shall be identified by a legible sign stating: “EMERGENCY DRINKING WATER. ”Signs shall be readily visible and located near such fixtures and on the door to any room or closet in which such a fixture is located.
614.1.5 Retroactive requirement for existing buildings. Existing buildings greater than five stories that supply potable water from the public water main for dwelling units and sleeping units in occupancy groups I-1, R-1, R-2, and R-3 with the assistance of pumps shall be provided with fixtures capable of supplying an emergency source of potable water in accordance with this section within 8 years after the effective date of this section.

Exception: Areas in such existing buildings greater than five stories where emergency fixtures are installed are not required to comply with Section 1104.3 or 1107.3 of the New York City Building Code unless where required pursuant to Section 1101.3.

§ 3. Article 315 of chapter 3 of title 28 of the administrative code of the city of New York, as added by a local law of the city of New York for the year 2013 amending the administrative code of the city of New York, the New York city plumbing code, the New York city building code, the New York city mechanical code and the New York city fuel gas code, relating to bringing such codes up to date with the 2009 editions of the international building, mechanical, fuel gas and plumbing codes, as proposed in Intro. 1056, is amended by adding a new section 28-315.8 to read as follows:
§28-315.8 Resiliency. The work specified in this section to enhance building resiliency shall be completed by the dates specified herein.

§28-315.8.1 Emergency source of water for residential occupancies. Within 8 years after the effective date of this section, existing buildings greater than five stories in occupancy groups I-1, R-1,  R-2, and R-3 that supply potable water from the public water main to occupants with the assistance of pumps, other than pumps connected to an emergency or a standby power system that complies with the requirements of chapter 27 of the New York city building code, shall be equipped with additional fixtures capable of supplying potable water to occupants utilizing only the available pressure from the public water main in compliance with section 614 of the New York city plumbing code.


§ 4. This local law shall take effect on the same date as a local law of the city of New York for the year 2013 amending the administrative code of the city of New York, the New York city plumbing code, the New York city building code, the New York city mechanical code and the New York city fuel gas code, relating to bringing such codes up to date with the 2009 editions of the international building, mechanical, fuel gas and plumbing codes, as proposed in Intro. 1056, takes effect.

JCH   11/13/2013  1:45 PM
Proposed Int. No. 1101-A

By Council Members Vacca, Chin, James, Koo, Lander, Mendez, Recchia, Richards, Rose and Gentile

A LOCAL LAW

To amend the administrative code of the city of New York, the New York city building code, and the New York city mechanical code, in relation to emergency and standby power systems and natural gas usage.

Be it enacted by the Council as follows:

Section 1. The New York city amendments to sections 700.1, 700.4, 700.5, 700.6 and 700.12 and articles 701 and 702 of the 2008 National Electrical Code as set forth in section 27-3025 of the administrative code of the city of New York, as added by local law number 39 for the year 2011, are amended to read as follows:

[SECTION 700.1 
Section 700.1–Delete FPN Nos. 2, 3, 4 and 5 and revise second sentence to read as follows:

Emergency systems are lighting, fire protection and power systems legally required and classed as emergency by any governmental agency having jurisdiction.]


SECTION 700.4

Subsection 700.4(A)—Revise to read as follows:

(A) Acceptance Test. A licensed professional shall submit to the department a testing report of the [completed] complete system upon installation. Such testing report shall be from an authorized testing entity.

Subsection 700.4(E)—Revise to read as follows:

(E) Installation Test Requirements. The installation test shall be conducted and documented in accordance with NFPA 110-2005, Section 7-13, amended as follows:

7.13.3: Delete in its entirety.

[7.13.4.1(5): Add at the end of (5): Time to initial load transfer shall not exceed 10 seconds.] 

7.13.4.1(11): Revise to read as follows: The load test with building load or other loads that simulate intended load shall continue for 2 hours observing and recording load changes and the resultant effect on voltage and frequency.

7.13.10.2: Delete and replace with the following: The complete crank/rest cycle shall consist of 3-15 second crank cycles with 15 second rest periods between cranks.

7.13.13: Add a new paragraph to read as follows: Transfer switches shall be tested in accordance with 8.4.6 as modified herein.

Subsection 700.4(F)—Add a new subsection 700.4(F) to read as follows:

(F) Maintenance and Operational Testing. Maintenance and operational testing shall be performed and documented in accordance with NFPA 110-2005, Section 8, amended as follows:

 [8.1.2: Delete in its entirety.] 

8.2: Delete in its entirety.

[8.3.1: Delete the following text from the end: “for the type and for the time duration specified for the class.”]

8.3.4: Delete and replace with the following: A written record of the EPSS inspection, tests, exercising, operation, and repairs shall be maintained on premises and made available to the department on request. Records shall be inclusive of the transfer switches and storage batteries.

8.4.4.1: Add a new sentence to read as follows: Inspection shall consist of examination of all EPSS components for leaks, abnormal device position and of all alarm/trouble indicators.

8.4.5: Delete in its entirety.

8.4.6: Replace "monthly" with "semi-annually".

8.4.6.1: Replace "monthly" with "semi-annually".

SECTION 700.5

Subsection 700.5 (B)–Delete third paragraph of subsection 700.5(B)[, revise the first paragraph of such subsection] and add a FPN to read as follows: 

[The alternate power source shall be permitted to supply emergency and optional standby system loads where the source has adequate capacity or where automatic selective load pickup and load shedding is provided as needed to ensure adequate power to (1) emergency circuits and (2) optional standby circuits, in that order of priority. The alternate power source shall be permitted for peak load shaving, provided the above conditions are met.] 

FPN: Peak reduction program may require utility approval.

SECTION 700.6

Subsection 700.6 (E)—Add a new subsection 700.6(E) to read as follows:

(E) Mechanical Operation. Means shall be provided to mechanically operate the switch without hazard to personnel.

Subsection 700.6 (F)–Add a new subsection 700.6(F) to read as follows:

(F) Temporary Connections for Portable Generators. Temporary connection of a portable generator without transfer equipment shall be permitted where qualified persons maintain and supervise service of the installation, and where the normal source of supply is physically isolated by a lockable [disconnect] disconnecting means or by disconnection of the normal supply conductors. Portable generators shall not be paralleled except by special permission.

Subsection 700.6 (G)—Add a new subsection 700.6(G) to read as follows:

(G) Permanent Connections for Portable Generators. Where a permanent [installation] connection is made for a portable generator, a disconnecting means and overcurrent protection shall be provided at the point of connection for the portable generator. Capacity shall not exceed the capacity of the permanent installation.

SECTION 700.12 

Section 700.12 – Revise the fourth paragraph, add a new Exception to read as follows and delete the FPNs: 

Fire, sprinkler, standpipe, smoke detection, oxygen, nitrous oxide and other alarm or extinguishing systems shall be connected to the line side of the service equipment and shall have separate overcurrent protection. 

Exception: Such systems installed for local area protection only, may connect ahead of the supply to the area protected. 

Subsection 700.12(A) – Revise the first paragraph and add a FPN to read as follows: 

Storage batteries may be used as a source of power for emergency lighting systems and shall be of suitable rating and capacity to supply and maintain the total load for a minimum period of 1½ hours, without the voltage applied to the load falling below 87½ percent of normal. Storage batteries may be used for other emergency systems only where special permission is granted for such use. 

FPN: See Article 760 for additional information on the use of batteries for fire alarm systems. 

Subsection 700.12(B)(2) – Revise first sentence and add a FPN to read as follows: 

Where internal combustion engines are used as the prime mover, an on-site fuel supply shall be provided sufficient for not less than 6 hours of operation at full demand load. 

FPN: Some installations may require more than 6 hours of fuel supply. See Articles 517 and 708. 

Subsection 700.12(B)(6) – Revise to read as follows: 

(6) Outdoor Generator Sets. Where an outdoor generator set is permanently installed and is equipped with a disconnecting means and such generator set is located within sight of the building or structure supplied, an additional disconnecting means shall not be required where ungrounded conductors pass through the building or structure. Appropriate signage shall be provided at the generator set and at the first disconnecting means within the building or structure supplied. 

Subsection 700.12(B)(7) – Add new subsection 700.12(B)(7) to read as follows: 

(7) Temporary Generators. The equipment grounding conductor(s) of the derived system shall be bonded to the grounding electrode system. 

FPN: See 250.34 for grounding of generator frame. 

(a) Separately Derived System. Where a temporary portable generator is a separately derived system, it shall be grounded in accordance with 250.30.

(b) Not A Separately Derived System. Where a temporary portable generator is not a separately derived system, a grounding connection shall not be made to the grounded circuit conductor. 

Subsection 700.12(C) – Revise to read as follows: 

(C) Uninterruptible Power Supplies. Uninterruptible power supplies may be used to provide power for emergency systems only where special permission is granted for such use. 

Subsection 700.12(D) – Revise the first sentence of subsection to read as follows: 

Where acceptable to the commissioner as suitable for use as an emergency source, a second service independent of the source normally supplying the building shall be permitted. 

Subsection 700.12(E) – [Delete the subsection in its entirety] Revise the first sentence to read as follows: Fuel cell systems shall be permitted to be used as a source of power for emergency systems in R-2 occupancies and shall be of suitable rating and capacity to supply and maintain the total load for not less than 6 hours of full-demand operation.
ARTICLE 701 

Legally Required Standby Systems 

[Delete the article in its entirety and add a FPN to read as follows: 

FPN: All legally required standby systems are classified as emergency systems.]

SECTION 701.5

Subsection 701.5(A)–Revise to read as follows: 

(A) Acceptance Test. A licensed professional shall submit to the department a testing report of the complete system upon installation. Such testing report shall be from an authorized testing entity.

Subsection 701.5(E)–Revise to read as follows:

(E) Installation Test Requirements. The installation test shall be conducted and documented in accordance with 700.4(E).
Subsection 701.5(F)–Add a new subsection 701.5(F) to read as follows:

(F) Maintenance and Operational Testing. Maintenance and operational testing shall be performed and documented in accordance with 700.4(F).
SECTION 701.6

Section 701.6–Add a new FPN to read as follows:

FPN: Peak reduction program may require utility approval.

SECTION 701.7

Subsection 701.7(D)–Add a new subsection 701.7(D) to read as follows:

(D) Mechanical Operation. Means shall be provided to mechanically operate the switch without hazard to personnel.

Subsection 701.7(E)–Add a new subsection 701.7(E) to read as follows:

(E) Temporary Connections for Portable Generators. Temporary connection of a portable generator without transfer equipment shall be permitted where qualified persons maintain and supervise service of the installation, and where the normal source of supply is physically isolated by a lockable disconnecting means or by a disconnection of the normal supply conductors. Portable generators shall not be paralleled except by special permission.

Subsection 701.7(F) – Add a new subsection 701.7(F) to read as follows:

(F) Permanent Connections for Portable Generators. Where a permanent connection is made for a portable generator, a disconnecting means and overcurrent protection shall be provided at the point of connection for the portable generator. Capacity shall not exceed the capacity of the permanent installation.

SECTION 701.8

Section 701.8 – Revise the first sentence to read as follows:

Audible and visual signal devices shall be provided at a continuously supervised location for the following purposes:

SECTION 701.10

Section 701.10 – Revise to read as follows:

701.10 Wiring and Conductors for Legally Required Standby Systems.

(A) Wiring. Wiring for legally required standby systems shall be permitted to occupy the same raceways, cables, boxes, and cabinets as other general wiring.

(B) Conductors.

(1) Ampacity. See 445.13.

(2) Installation of Generator Conductors. Generator conductors to the first disconnecting means shall be installed in accordance with the requirements of Article 230.

(3) Overcurrent Devices. There shall be no limit to the number of overcurrent devices connected to the generator terminal devices.

SECTION 701.11

Subsection 701.11(B)(2)–Revise to read as follows:

(2) Internal Combustion Engines as Prime Mover. Where internal combustion engines are used as the prime mover, an on-site fuel supply shall be provided sufficient for not less than 6 hours of operation at full demand load.

Exception: Legally required standby generators relying on natural gas as a fuel supply shall not be required to maintain an on-site fuel supply.

FPN: Some installations may require more than 6 hours of fuel supply. See Articles 517 and 708. 

Subsection 701.11(B)(6)–Add a new subsection 701.11(B)(6) to read as follows:

(6) Temporary Generators. The equipment grounding conductors of the derived system shall be bonded to the grounding electrode system.

FPN: See 250.34 for grounding of the generator frame.

(a) Separately Derived System. Where a temporary portable generator is a separately derived system, it shall be grounded in accordance with 250.30.

(b) Not A Separately Derived System. Where a temporary portable generator is not a separately derived system, a grounding connection shall not be made to the grounded circuit conductor.

Subsection 701.11(F) – Revise the first sentence to read as follows: Fuel cell systems used as a source of power for legally required standby systems shall be of suitable rating and capacity to supply and maintain the total load for not less than 6 hours of full-demand operation.

SECTION 701.18

Section 701.18–Revise to read as follows:

701.18 Coordination. Legally required standby system(s) overcurrent devices shall be selectively coordinated in the overcurrent range with all supply side overcurrent protective devices.

ARTICLE 702

Optional Standby Systems

SECTION 702.2

Section 702.2–Revise the first sentence to read as follows:

Those systems not required by municipal, state, federal, or other codes or by any governmental agency having jurisdiction.

SECTION 702.6
Section 702.6–At the Exception, add a second sentence to read as follows:

Portable generators shall not be paralleled with permanent optional standby sources, except by special permission.

SECTION 702.12

Section 702.12–Add a new section 702.12 to read as follows:

702.12 Portable and Temporary Generators. Portable and temporary generators shall comply with 700.6(G) and 700.12(B)(7).
§2. Item 3.9 of section 28-109.3 of the administrative code of the city of New York, as added by local law 33 for the year 2007, is amended to read as follows:  

3.9. Emergency and standby power systems.

§3. Section 402.12 of the New York city building code, as added by local law number 33 for the year 2007, is amended to read as follows:

402.12 [Emergency] Standby power. Covered mall buildings exceeding 50,000 square feet (4645 m2) shall be provided with [emergency] standby power systems that are capable of operating the emergency voice/alarm communication system.

§4. Sections 403.10 and 403.11 of the New York city building code, as added by local law number 33 for the year 2007, are amended to read as follows:

403.10 [Reserved.] Standby power. A standby power system complying with Section 2702 shall be provided for standby power loads specified in Section 403.10.2.
403.10.1 Special requirements for standby power systems. If the standby system is a generator set inside a building, the system shall be located in a separate room enclosed with 2-hour fire-resistance-rated fire barrier assemblies. System supervision with manual start and transfer features shall be provided at the fire command center.

403.10.2 Standby power loads in occupancies other than Group R-2. In buildings of any occupancy group other than Group R-2, the following are classified as standby power loads:

1. Power and lighting for fire command center required by Section 403.8;

2. Ventilation and automatic fire detection equipment for smokeproof enclosures;

3. Elevators, in accordance with Section 3003; and

4. Stair pressurization systems when provided.

403.10.3 Standby power loads in Group R-2 occupancies. Group R-2 occupancies in buildings greater than 125 feet (38 100 mm) in height shall be required to provide a standby power system to support the following loads:

1. Power and lighting for fire command center required by Section 403.8;

2. Ventilation and automatic fire detection equipment for smokeproof enclosures;

3. At least one elevator serving all floors, or one elevator per bank where different banks serve different portions of the building; and

4. Stair pressurization systems when provided.

403.11 Emergency power systems. An emergency power system complying with Section 2702 shall be provided for emergency power loads specified in Sections 403.11.1 and 403.11.2.

403.11.1 Emergency power loads in occupancies other than R-2. In buildings of any occupancy group other than Group R-2, the following are classified as emergency power loads:
1. Exit signs and means of egress illumination required by Chapter 10; [and]

2. Elevator car lighting; [and]

3. Emergency voice/alarm communications systems; [and]

4. Automatic fire detection systems; [and]

5. Fire alarm systems; and

6. [Power and lighting for the fire command center required by Section 403.8; and

7.] Electrically powered fire pumps[; and 

8. Ventilation and automatic fire detection equipment for smokeproof enclosures; and

9. Elevators in accordance with Section 3003; and

10. Stair pressurization systems when provided].

403.11.2 Emergency power loads in Group R-2 occupancies. Group R-2 occupancies in buildings greater than 125 feet (38 100 mm) in height shall be required to provide an emergency power system to support the following loads:

1. Exit signs and means of egress illumination required by Chapter 10;

[2. At least one elevator serving all floors, or one elevator per bank where different banks serve different portions of the building;]

[3.] 2. Emergency voice communications systems; and

[4.] 3. Electrically powered fire pumps, unless electrical power to the motor is taken ahead of the main from the street side of the house service switch.

[Where a generator is used as the emergency power system, diesel or gas shall be permitted as the fuel source in accordance with Section 2702.1.]


§5. Section 404.6 of the New York city building code, as amended by local law number 33 for the year 2007, is amended to read as follows:
404.6 [Emergency] Standby power. Equipment required to provide smoke control shall be connected to [an emergency] a standby power sys​tem in accordance with Section 909.11.

§6. Sections 405.9 and 405.10 of the New York city building code, as amended by local law number 33 for the year 2007, are amended to read as follows:
405.9 [Reserved.] Standby power. A standby power system complying with Section 2702 shall be provided for standby power loads specified in Section 405.9.1. 
405.9.1 Standby power loads. The following loads are classified as standby power loads:

1. Smoke control system;

2. Ventilation and automatic fire detection equipment for smokeproof enclosures;

3. Fire pumps;

4. Elevators in accordance with Section 3003; and

5. Stair pressurization systems when provided.

405.10 Emergency power. An emergency power system complying with Section 2702 shall be provided for emergency power loads specified in Section 405.10.1.

405.10.1 Emergency power loads. The following loads are classified as emergency power loads:

1. Emergency voice/alarm communications systems[.];

2. Fire alarm systems[.];

3. Automatic fire detection systems[.];

4. Elevator car lighting[.]; and
5. Means of egress and exit sign illumination as required by Chapter 10.
[6. Smoke control system.

7. Ventilation and automatic fire detection equipment for smokeproof enclosures.

8. Fire pumps.

9. Elevators in accordance with Section 3003.

10. Stair pressurization systems when provided.]
§7. Section 414.5.4 of the New York city building code, as amended by local law number 33 for the year 2007, is amended to read as follows:
414.5.4 Emergency or standby power. Where mechanical ventilation, treatment systems, temperature control, alarm, detection or other electrically operated systems are required, such sys​tems shall be provided with an emergency or standby power system in accordance with the New York City Electrical Code.

Exceptions:

1. Storage areas for Class I and II oxidizers.

2. Storage areas for Class III, IV and V organic per​oxides.

3. [Emergency] Standby power for mechanical ventilation, treatment systems and temperature control systems shall not be required where an approved fail-safe engineered system is installed.

§8. Sections 909.11 and 909.20.6.2 of the New York city building code, as added by local law number 33 for the year 2007, are amended to read as follows:

909.11 Power systems. The smoke control system shall be supplied with two sources of power. Primary power shall be from the normal building power systems. Secondary power shall be from [an emergency] a standby power source complying with the New York City Electrical Code. The [emergency] standby power source and its transfer switches shall be in a separate room from the normal power transformers and switch gear and shall be enclosed in a room constructed of not less than 1-hour fire-resistance-rated fire barriers ventilated directly to and from the exterior. Power distribution from the two sources shall be by independent routes. Transfer to full [emergency] standby power shall be automatic and within 60 seconds of failure of the primary power. The systems shall comply with the New York City Electrical Code.

909.20.6.2 [Emergency] Standby power. Mechanical vestibule and stair shaft ventilation systems and automatic fire detection systems shall be powered by [an emergency] a standby power system conforming to Section [403.11] 403.10 and Chapter 27.

§9. Sections 1007.4, 1007.5, and 1008.1.3.3 of the New York city building code, as added by local law number 33 for the year 2007, are amended to read as follows:

1007.4 Elevators. To be considered part of an accessible means of egress, an elevator shall comply with the emergency operation and signaling device requirements of Section 2.27 of ASME A17.1 and Section 1109.6. [Emergency] Standby power shall be provided in accordance with Sections 2702 and 3003. The elevator shall be accessed from either an area of rescue assistance complying with Section 1007.6 or a horizontal exit complying with Section 1021.

Exceptions:

1. Elevators are not required to be accessed from an area of rescue assistance or horizontal exit in open parking garages.

2. Elevators are not required to be accessed from an area of rescue assistance or horizontal exit in buildings and facilities equipped throughout with an automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3.1.1 or 903.3.1.2. 
1007.5 Platform lifts. Platform (wheelchair) lifts shall not serve as part of an accessible means of egress, except where allowed as part of a required accessible route in Section 1109.7. Platform lifts shall be installed in accordance with ASME A18.1. [Emergency] Standby power shall be provided in accordance with Section 2702 for platform lifts permitted to serve as part of an accessible means of egress.

1008.1.3.3 Horizontal sliding doors. In other than Group H occupancies, horizontal sliding doors permitted to be a component of a means of egress in accordance with Exception 5 to Section 1008.1.2.1 shall comply with all of the following criteria:

1. The doors shall be power operated and shall be capable of being operated manually in the event of power failure.

2. The doors shall be openable by a simple method from both sides without special knowledge or effort.

3. The force required to operate the door shall not exceed 30 pounds (133 N) to set the door in motion and 15 pounds (67 N) to close the door or open it to the minimum required width.

4. The door shall be openable with a force not to exceed 15 pounds (67 N) when a force of 250 pounds (1100 N) is applied perpendicular to the door adjacent to the operating device.

5. The door assembly shall comply with the applicable fire protection rating and, where rated, shall be self-closing or automatic-closing by smoke detection, shall be installed in accordance with NFPA 80 and shall comply with Section 715.

6. The door assembly shall have an integrated [emergency] standby power supply.

7. The door assembly power supply shall be electrically supervised.

8. The door shall open to the minimum required width within 10 seconds after activation of the operating device.

§10. Section 1707.7 of the New York city building code, as added by local law number 33 for the year 2007, is amended to read as follows:

1707.7 Mechanical and electrical components. Periodic spe​cial inspection is required during the anchorage of electrical equipment for emergency or standby power systems in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category C[,] or D. Periodic special inspection is required during the installation of piping systems intended to carry flammable, combustible or highly toxic contents and their associated mechanical units in structures assigned to Seis​mic Design Category C[,] or D. Periodic special inspection is required during the installation of HVAC ductwork that will contain hazardous materials in structures assigned to Seismic Design Category C[,] or D.

§11. Section BC 2702 of the New York city building code, as added by local law number 33 for the year 2007, is amended to read as follows:

SECTION BC 2702 EMERGENCY AND STANDBY POWER SYSTEMS

2702.1 Installation. Emergency and standby power systems shall be installed in accordance with the New York City Electrical Code, NFPA 110 and NFPA 111[, and]. Systems relying on fuel supplies shall have an on-premises fuel supply sufficient for not less than 6-hour full-demand operation of the system. However, [for R-2 occupancies required to provide emergency power systems pursuant to the provisions of Section 403.11.2, and for voluntarily installed emergency power systems,] natural gas from the public utility street main shall be permitted as the sole fuel supply for (i) emergency power systems serving R-2 occupancies and (ii) standby power systems, provided that an outside gas cut-off valve separate from other gas services is installed in accordance with Section E.6 of Appendix E of the New York City Fuel Gas Code. 

2702.1.1 Stationary generators. Emergency and standby power generators shall be listed in accordance with UL 2200.

2702.1.2 Capacity. The emergency and standby power [system] systems shall have [a] capacity and [rating] ratings that [supplies] supply all equipment required to be operational at the same time.

2702.2 Where required. Emergency and standby power systems shall be provided where required by this section.

2702.2.1 Group A occupancies. Emergency power shall be provided for voice/alarm communication systems in Group A occupancies in accordance with Section 907.2.1.2.

2702.2.2 Smoke control systems. [Emergency] Standby power shall be provided for smoke control systems in accordance with Section 909.11.

2702.2.3 Exit signs. Emergency power shall be provided for exit signs in accordance with Section 1011.5.3.

2702.2.4 Means of egress illumination. Emergency power shall be provided for means of egress illumination in accordance with Section 1006.3.

2702.2.5 Accessible means of egress elevators. [Emergency] Standby power shall be provided for elevators that are part of an accessible means of egress in accordance with Section 1007.4.
2702.2.6 Horizontal sliding doors. [Emergency] Standby power shall be provided for horizontal sliding doors in accordance with Section 1008.1.3.3.
2702.2.7 Semiconductor fabrication facilities. Emergency power shall be provided for semiconductor fabrication facilities in accordance with Section 415.9.10.

2702.2.8 Membrane structures. [Emergency] Standby power shall be provided for auxiliary inflation systems in accordance with Section 3102.8.2. Emergency power shall be provided for exit signs in tents and membrane structures. 

2702.2.9 Hazardous materials. Emergency or standby power shall be provided in occupancies with hazardous materials in accordance with Section 414.5.4 and the New York City Fire Code.

2702.2.10 Highly toxic and toxic materials. Emergency power shall be provided for occupancies with highly toxic or toxic materials in accordance with the New York City Fire Code.

2702.2.11 Organic peroxides. [Emergency] Standby power shall be provided for occupancies with organic peroxides in accordance with the New York City Fire Code.

2702.2.12 Pyrophoric materials. Emergency power shall be provided for occupancies with silane gas in accordance with the New York City Fire Code.

2702.2.13 Covered mall buildings. [Emergency] Standby power shall be provided for voice/alarm communication systems in covered mall buildings in accordance with Section 402.12.

2702.2.14 High-rise buildings. Emergency and standby power shall be provided in high-rise buildings in accordance with [Section] Sections 403.10 and 403.11.

2702.2.15 Underground buildings. Emergency and standby power shall be provided in underground buildings in accordance with [Section] Sections 405.9 and 405.10.

2702.2.16 Group I-3 occupancies. Emergency power shall be provided for doors in Group I-3 occupancies in accordance with Section 408.4.2.

2702.2.17 Reserved.

2702.2.18 Elevators. [Emergency] Standby power for elevators, including elevators provided to accommodate ambulance stretchers pursuant to Section 3002.4, shall be provided as set forth in Section 3003.1.
2702.2.19 Smokeproof enclosures and pressurized elevator shaft. [Emergency] Standby power shall be provided for smoke-proof enclosures as required by Section 909.20 and for pressurized elevator shafts provided in accordance with Item 5 of Section 403.9.1.1.

2702.2.20 Occupancy Groups B, E and R-1. [An emergency] Emergency and standby power [system] shall be required in those Group B, E and R-1 occupancies specified in this section:

1. Group B occupancies with occupied floor less than 75 feet (22 860 mm) above the lowest fire department vehicle access having a gross floor area over 15,000 square feet (1393.6 m2) per floor or a total gross floor area of 100,000 square feet (9290.3 m2) or more.

2. Group E occupancies with occupied floor less than 75 feet (22 860 mm) above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access having a gross floor area over 15,000 square feet (1[,]393.6 m2) per floor or a total gross floor area of 100,000 square feet (9[,] 290.3 m2) or more.

3. All Group R-1 occupancies.

2702.2.20.1 Equipment requiring emergency power system. With respect to such [occupancy] Occupancy Groups B, E and R-1, the following equipment, where such equipment is required by this code, shall be provided with an emergency power system:

1. Exit signs and means of egress illumination required by Chapter 10;

2. Elevator car lighting;

3. Emergency voice/alarm communications systems;

4. Automatic fire detection systems; 

5. Fire alarm systems; and

6. Electrically powered fire pumps[;

7. Ventilating systems used for smoke venting or control;

8. Stair pressurization; and

9. At least three elevators in a building at one time with manual transfer to other elevators as required by Section 3003].

2702.2.20.2 Equipment requiring standby power system. With respect to such Occupancy Groups B, E and R-1, the following equipment, where such equipment is required by this code, shall be provided with a standby power system:

1. Ventilating systems used for smoke venting or control;

2. Stair pressurization; and

3. At least three elevators in a building at one time with manual transfer to other elevators as required by Section 3003.

2702.3 Maintenance. Emergency and standby power systems shall be maintained and tested in accordance with the New York City Fire Code and New York City Electrical Code.

2702.4 Required loads for optional standby power systems. In addition to any other loads, optional standby power systems shall be capable of providing power to the following systems upon failure of the normal power supply or the emergency or standby power system:

1. Emergency lighting;

2. Fire alarm systems; and

3. Elevators as follows:

3.1 For Group R-2 occupancies in buildings greater than 125 feet (38 100 mm) in height, at least one elevator serving all floors, or one elevator per bank where different banks serve different portions of the building; or

3.2 For all other buildings having occupied floors located more than 75 feet (22 860 mm) above the lowest level of fire department vehicle access, at least one elevator that serves all floors.

§12. Sections 3003.1, 3003.1.1, 3003.1.2, 3003.1.3, and 3003.1.4 of the New York city building code, as added by local law number 33 for the year 2007, are amended to read as follows:

3003.1 [Emergency] Standby power. In buildings and structures where [emergency] standby power is required or furnished to operate an eleva​tor, the operation shall be in accordance with Sections 3003.1.1 through 3003.1.4.

3003.1.1 Manual transfer. [Emergency] Standby power shall be manually transferable to all elevators in each bank.

3003.1.2 One elevator. Where only one elevator is installed, the elevator shall automatically transfer to [emer​gency] standby power within 60 seconds after failure of normal power.

3003.1.3 Two or more elevators. Where two or more eleva​tors are controlled by a common operating system, all eleva​tors shall automatically transfer to [emergency] standby power within 60 seconds after failure of normal power where the [emer​gency] standby power source is of sufficient capacity to operate all elevators at the same time. Where the [emergency] standby power source is not of sufficient capacity to operate all elevators at the same time, all elevators shall transfer to [emergency] standby power in sequence, return to the designated landing and dis​connect from the [emergency] standby power source. After all eleva​tors have been returned to the designated level, at least three elevators shall remain operable from the [emergency] standby power source.

3003.1.4 Venting. Where [emergency] standby power is connected to elevators, the machine room ventilation or air conditioning shall be connected to the [emergency] standby power source.

§13. Section 3102.8.2 of the New York city building code, as added by local law number 33 for the year 2007, is amended to read as follows:

3102.8.2 [Emergency] Standby power. Wherever an auxiliary inflation system is required, an approved [emergency] standby power-generating system shall be provided. However, notwithstanding Section 2702.1, the [emergency] standby power-generating system shall be equipped with a suitable means for automatically starting the generator set upon failure of the normal electrical service and for automatic transfer and operation of all of the required electrical functions at full power within 60 seconds of such service failure. [Emergency] Standby power shall be capable of operating independently for a minimum of 4 hours.

§14. Section 513.11 of the New York city mechanical code, as added by local law number 33 for the year 2007, is amended to read as follows:

513.11 Power systems. The smoke control system shall be supplied with two sources of power. Primary power shall be the normal building power systems. Secondary power shall be from an approved [emergency] standby power source complying with the New York City Electrical Code. The [emergency] standby power source and its transfer switches shall be in a separate room from the normal power transformers and switch gear and shall be enclosed in a room constructed of not less than 1-hour fire-resistance-rated fire barriers, ventilated directly to and from the exterior. Power distribution from the two sources shall be by independent routes. Transfer to full [emergency] standby power shall be automatic and within 60 seconds of failure of the primary power. The systems shall comply with the New York City Electrical Code.

§15. This local law shall take effect immediately.

11/13/13 9:08PM

� Hurricane Sandy Advisory Archive, National Oceanic and Atmospheric Administration Hurricane Center, available online at � HYPERLINK "http://www.nhc.noaa.gov/archive/2012/SANDY.shtml" �http://www.nhc.noaa.gov/archive/2012/SANDY.shtml�; Hurricane Sandy After Action Plan (May 2013), pg. 4, available online at � HYPERLINK "http://www.nyc.gov/html/recovery/downloads/pdf/sandy_aar_5.2.13.pdf" �http://www.nyc.gov/html/recovery/downloads/pdf/sandy_aar_5.2.13.pdf�; Special Initiative for Rebuilding and Resiliency report, pgs. 11-18, available online at: � HYPERLINK "http://nytelecom.vo.llnwd.net/o15/agencies/sirr/SIRR_spreads_Lo_Res.pdf" �http://nytelecom.vo.llnwd.net/o15/agencies/sirr/SIRR_spreads_Lo_Res.pdf�.


� SIRR report, pg. 5; After Action Plan, pg. 1. 


� SIRR report, pg. 34.


� Mireya Navarro, “After Storm, Dry Floors Prove Value of Exceeding City Code,” New York Times (Nov. 23, 2012), available online at � HYPERLINK "http://www.nytimes.com/2012/11/24/science/earth/new-york-reassessing-building-code-to-limit-storm-damage.html?_r=0" �http://www.nytimes.com/2012/11/24/science/earth/new-york-reassessing-building-code-to-limit-storm-damage.html?_r=0�.


� BRTF report, pg. 4, available online at � HYPERLINK "http://www.urbangreencouncil.org/BuildingResiliency" �http://www.urbangreencouncil.org/BuildingResiliency�.


� BRTF report, pg. 5.





Page 1 of 46

